



**BID RECAP**

SOLICITATION TITLE: **N95 Masks**  
 SOLICITATION NUMBER: **IFB-5017-22-KH**  
 OPENING DATE: **2/22/2022**  
 OPENING TIME: **2:00 PM**  
 PROJECT MANAGER: **Mark McIntire**  
 BUYER NAME: **Kassy Hackett**

Company	Contractor's Bid Form	Acknowledged Addenda 1-2	Addendum 1 Contractor's Bid Form	Item 1 - Extended Price	Item 1- Qty. in a box	Item 1 - Delivery	Item 2 - Extended Price	Item 2- Qty. in a box	Item 3 - Extended Price	Item 3- Qty. in a box	Item 2 & 3 - Brand	Item 2 & 3 - Delivery	Comments
After Action Medical and Dental Supply LLC	Yes	Yes	Yes	\$28,800.00	35	7 days	\$7,200.00	35	\$7,200.00	35	Halyard Fluidshield*	7 days	*Submitted same brand for Items 2-3 as Item 1
Agni Enterprises LLC dba Head to Heels Safety Supplies	Yes	Yes	No*										*Non-Responsive
Airgas Intermountain	Yes	Yes	Yes	\$55,086.00	35	7-10 days	\$2,659.50	20	\$2,530.50	20	3M 82105	14-21 days	
Alphapromed LLC	Yes	No	No*										*Non-Responsive
Aptos Logistics, Inc	Yes	Yes	No*										*Non-Responsive
Bound Tree Medical	Yes	Yes	Yes	\$49,050.00	35	3-14 days	\$3,592.50	20	\$3,592.50	20	Moldex-Metric	3-14 days	
Bttn Technologies, Inc	Yes	No	Yes	\$42,840.00	35	10-14 days	No Bid	n/a	No Bid	n/a	n/a	n/a	
By Love Inc.	Yes	Yes	Yes	No Bid	n/a	n/a	No Bid*	n/a	\$1,350.00	20	Harley L-1888 Folding N95	5-7 business days	*Non-Responsive (Items 2 & 3 had to be bid together)
Cecilia Tech Inc	Yes	Yes	Yes	No Bid	n/a	n/a	\$402.00	20	\$282.00	20	3M 1860, BYD Care	14-21 days	*Non-Responsive (Did not submit same brand for items 2 & 3) **Prompt Payment discount of 2% if paid within 15 days
Cleanguard LLC	Yes	Yes	Yes	\$24,996.00	35	5-7 days	\$4,390.50	20	\$4,390.50	20	Moldex 507-1511 & 507-1512	3-4 days	
D'S Ventures, LLC dba LogMet Solutions	Yes	No	No*										*Non-Responsive
Ever Ready First Aid	Yes	No	No*										*Non-Responsive
Heaven's Ark Enterprise LLC	Yes	Yes	No*										*Non-Responsive
Henry Schein Inc	Yes	Yes	Yes	No Bid	n/a	n/a	\$5,775.00	35	\$5,775.00	35	OM Halyard 46827 & 46727	2-3 days	
Holzberg Communications Inc	Yes	Yes	Yes	\$54,390.00	35	30 days	\$4,050.00	20	\$2,070.00	20	Moldex, 3M	30 days	
Hujaya Supply	Yes	Yes	Yes	Not OMHF Brand*	n/a	n/a	\$2,670.00	20	\$2,670.00	20	Drager X-Plore 1350	3 days	*Item 1 Pricing was not for OM Halyard Fluidshield brand
Hundley Industries	Yes	Yes	Yes	\$25,950.00	35	14-16 days	No Bid	n/a	No Bid	n/a	n/a	n/a	
Hutchins & Hutchins, Inc	Yes	No	Yes	\$24,780.00	35	10	\$6,195.00	35	\$6,195.00	35	O&M Halyard Fluidshield*	10 days	*Submitted same brand for Items 2-3 as Item 1. **Only sells by the CASE 6 boxes/case. ***Prompt Payment Discount of 2% if paid within 10 days
Lawson Products Inc	Yes	Yes	No*										*Non-Responsive
Malor & Company Inc	Yes	Yes	No*										*Non-Responsive
Medical Shipment LLC	Yes	Yes	Yes	No Bid	n/a	n/a	\$3,748.50	20	\$3,748.50	20	Makrite Industries	7 days	
Mersi Distribution LLC	Yes	Yes	Yes	\$63,564.00	35	4-10 days	\$3,387.00	50	\$3,387.00	50	ACI	3-7 days	
Mini Wing USA	Yes	Yes	Yes	\$68,250.00	\$35.00	5-10 days	\$2,385.00	20	\$2,385.00	20	Benehal	1 day	
Munro Supply Inc	Yes	Yes	Yes	No Bid	n/a	n/a	\$2,686.50	20	\$2,361.00	20	3M	12-15 days	
Pacific Bridge Sourcing Management dba Benchmark Health	Yes	No	Yes	No Bid	n/a	n/a	\$1,860.00	20	\$1,860.00	20	9500-N95 Makrite	10 days	
Premier Medical Distribution	Yes	No	No*										*Non-Responsive
Pyramid School Products	Yes	Yes	Yes	No Bid	n/a	n/a	No Bid*	n/a	\$1,633.50	20	Impact	14-21	*Non-Responsive (Items 2 & 3 had to be bid together)
Rhino Medical Supply Inc	Yes	No	No*										*Non-Responsive
SanitizeNow Inc	Yes	Yes	Yes	\$26,880.00	\$35.00	15-28 business days	\$1,440.00	20	\$1,230.00	20	Benehal	3-17 business days	**Prompt Payment discount of 1% if paid within 10 days
Secure Our Schools LLC	Yes	Yes	Yes	\$29,400.00	\$35.00	10 days	No Bid	n/a	No Bid	n/a	n/a	n/a	
Sell-Able	No*	No	No*										*Non-Responsive
TMD Holdings LLC	No	Yes	No*										*Non-Responsive
Unifire Inc	Yes	Yes	Yes	No Bid	n/a	n/a	\$3,750.00	20	\$3,750.00	20	Unknown	30 days	
Uwepport LLC	Yes	Yes	Yes	No Bid	n/a	n/a	\$6,000.00	25	\$6,000.00	25	Advanced Concepts Innovations	7 days	**Prompt Payment discount of 2% if paid within 30 days
Vizocom ICT LLC	Yes	Yes	Yes	\$26,145.00	\$35.00	7-10 days	\$2,640.00	20	\$1,980.00	20	Makrite	5-7 days	**Prompt payment discount of 1% if paid within 5 days (PPD NOT VALID BECAUSE ITS LESSTHAN 10 DAYS)
Wurth Wood Group	Yes	No	No*										*Non-Responsive
YK Industries Inc.	Yes	Yes	No*										*Non-Responsive