



BID RECAP

SOLICITATION TITLE: **Nitrile Gloves**
 SOLICITATION NUMBER: **IFB-5021-2-KH**
 OPENING DATE: **2/22/2022**
 OPENING TIME: **2:30 PM**
 PROJECT MANAGER: **Mark McIntire / Chris Packard**
 BUYER NAME: **Kassy Hackett**

Company	Contractor's Bid Form	Acknowledged Addenda 1-2	Items 1-4 Extended Price	Items 1-4 Delivery	Items 5-8 Extended Price	Items 5-8 Delivery	Items 5-8 Brand	Comments	Prompt Payment Discount
After Action Medical and Dental Supply LLC	Yes	Yes	\$30,796.50	7 days	\$64,350.00	7 days	Halyard Purple Nitrile	*Did not bid Kimberly-Clark Brand Name Only for Items 1-4 (Halyard Brand)	
Agni Enterprises LLC dba Head to Heels Safety Supplies	Yes	Yes	\$32,310.60	5-7 business days	\$66,600.00	5-7 business days	Medgluv		
Airgas Intermountain	Yes	Yes	\$26,283.60	10 days	\$33,090.00	10 days	SW Safety Power Form	*Did not bid Kimberly-Clark Brand Name Only for Items 1-4 (Halyard Brand)	
Alphapromed LLC	Yes	Yes	No Bid	n/a	\$22,500.00	30 days	AlphaGlove		
Aptos Logistics Inc	Yes	Yes	\$45,643.50	2 days	\$44,700.00	3-5 days	Gloveworks by Ammex Black Nitrile Gloves	**Prompt Payment discount of 2% if paid within 10 days	\$44,730.63 \$43,806.00
B2B Solutions LLC	Yes	No*	\$45,805.20	10-14 days	\$50,730.00	10-14 days	Ammex GWBEN48100	*Only stated 1 addendum	
Bound Tree Medical	Yes	Yes	\$26,647.22	2-4 days	\$62,850.00	2-4 days	Ansell, Lifestar EC Gloves		
Cecilia Tech Inc	Yes	Yes	No Bid	n/a	\$23,940.00	14-21	Magicare	**Prompt Payment discount of 2% if paid within 15 days	\$23,461.20
Clean Space Project LLC	Yes	No*	No Bid	n/a	\$36,872.00	6 days	Clean Space Project	*Only stated 1 addendum. **Prompt Payment discount of 1% if paid within 10 days	\$36,503.28
Cleanguard LLC	Yes	No	\$52,920.00	3-4 days	\$25,200.00	4 days	Shamrok		
Essential Supplies Inc	No*	No						*Non-Responsive	
Heaven's Ark Enterprise LLC	Yes	Yes	No Bid	n/a	\$38,970.00	15-30 days	Raxwell or equal	*Prompt Payment discount of 0.5% if paid within 10 days	\$38,599.79
Henry Schein Inc	Yes	Yes	\$21,506.10	2-3 days	\$62,190.00	2-14 days	Microflex LifeStar		
Holzberg Communications	Yes	Yes	\$43,350.30	30 days	\$50,940.00	30 days	Midnight MK-296		
Hujaya Supply	Yes	Yes	\$42,559.00	Back ordered to end of March 2022	\$43,943.75	7-10 days	VWR Gloves		
Hundley Industries	Yes	Yes	\$22,785.00	14-16 days	\$20,850.00	5-7 days	AE Nitrile Exam Glove	*Did not bid Kimberly-Clark Brand Name Only for Items 1-4 (Halyard Brand) **Reference response to see comment about glove mil.	
ICS Jail Supplies Inc	Yes	Yes	\$99,122.10	30 days	\$139,230.00	30 days	Microflex Supreno		
Imperium Logistics LLC	Yes	Yes	No Bid	n/a	\$25,470.00	4-5 business days	GloveWorks Premium	*Prompt Payment discount of 0.5% if paid within 10 days (PPD NOT VALID BECAUSE ITS LESS THAN 10 DAYS)	\$25,228.04
Integres LLC	Yes	Yes	No Bid	n/a	\$45,000.00	20 business days	AMMEX GWBEN	*Prompt Payment discount of 5% if paid within 15 days	\$42,750.00
Interboro Packaging	Yes	Yes	No Bid	n/a	\$31,200.00	10-14 days	Aurelia/Safeko		

Lawson Products Inc.	Yes	Yes	No Bid	n/a	\$45,825.00	3 days	Sante/Eletop (M, L, XL) & Falcon (S)		
Mainetti USA	Yes	Yes	No Bid	n/a	\$13,500.00	7 or less days	KINGFA	*Prompt Payment discount of 3% if paid within 3 days (PPD NOT VALID BECAUSE ITS LESS THAN 10 DAYS)	
Malor & Company Inc	Yes	Yes	\$9,947.90	15 days	\$20,309.25	15 days	XYCLEM eCommerce	*Prompt Payment discount of 1% if paid within 5 days (PPD NOT VALID BECAUSE ITS LESS THAN 10 DAYS)	
MD 1 Care LLC	Yes	No*	No Bid	n/a	\$27,000.00	20 days	INTCO Advancare	*Only stated 1 addendum. **Prompt Payment discount of 5% if paid within 15 days.	\$25,650.00
Medzon Health	Yes	Yes	No Bid	n/a	\$45,300.00	14-21 days	Skintx		
Mersi Distribution LLC	Yes	Yes	\$33,222.00	3-7 days	\$41,070.00	3-5 days	Surecare		
Mini Wing Inc	Yes	Yes	\$63,210.00	5-10 days	\$29,250.00	5-10 days	Diamond & Shamrock		
Munro Supply Inc	Yes	Yes	\$44,732.10	12-14 days	\$27,990.00	12-14 days	Gloveworks		
My Central Supply	Yes	Yes	No Bid	n/a	\$28,770.00	14-21 days	Hospeco		
P H & S Products LLC	Yes	No*	No Bid	n/a	\$49,568.00	5 days	ResQ-Grip	*Only stated 1 addendum	
Pacific Bridge Sourcing Management dba Benchmark Health	Yes	No*	No Bid	n/a	\$19,500.00	10 days	Benchmark Health	*Only stated 1 addendum	
Pacific Satr Corporation	Yes	Yes	\$25,798.50	120 days	\$55,200.00	120 days	Unknown		
Performance Safety Group	Yes	Yes	No Bid	n/a	\$47,970.00	7-10 days	Med-Express Back		
PKJ International LLC	Yes	Yes	\$40,866.00	unknown	\$44,400.00	60 days	Ansell	*Price Valid until 2/28/2022. Kimber Clark is having a price increase on 3/1/2022.	
Premier Medical Distribution	Yes	No	No Bid	n/a	\$31,500.00	unknown	unknown	*Prompt Payment discount of 2% if paid within 10 days	\$30,870.00
Products Unlimited Inc.	Yes	Yes	No Bid	n/a	\$28,650.00	14 days	SureCare		
Pyramid School Products	Yes	Yes	No Bid	n/a	\$35,970.00	21-30 days	Hospeco		
QuadMed	Yes	Yes	\$39,396.00	10-14 business days	\$33,450.00	10-14 business days	EGL-51094x Series NitriDerm Ultra		
R.S. Hughes Co, Inc	Yes	No	\$30,523.00	7-10 business days	\$24,462.00	7-10 business days	SW Safety Power Form		
Renco Corporation	Yes	Yes	No Bid	n/a	\$54,000.00	60 days	Renco	*Prompt Payment discount of 1% if paid within 10 days	\$53,460.00
SanitizeNow Inc	Yes	Yes	\$34,295.10	15-28 business days	\$18,990.00	3-12 business days	Glovemas	*Prompt Payment discount of 1% if paid within 10 days	\$33,952.15 \$18,800.10
School Health Corporation	Yes	Yes	No Bid	n/a	\$29,889.50	5-10 days	Valiant		
Secure Our Schools LLC	Yes	Yes	\$55,125.00	10 days	No Bid	n/a	n/a		
Shamrock Marketing Co. Inc	Yes	No*	No Bid	n/a	\$24,000.00	10 days	Action	*Only stated 1 addendum. **Prompt Payment discount of 1% if paid within 10 days	\$23,760.00
Sidra Medical Supply Inc	Yes	Yes	\$26,460.00	7 days	\$54,000.00	7-10 days	Innovative Health		
TheSafetyHouse.com	Yes	No	\$36,750.00	30 days	\$54,000.00	30 days	Nitrile Care Premium		
Thomas Scientific	Yes	Yes	\$20,756.40	14-16 business days	\$42,642.40	14-16 business days	Kimberly Clark		
Tronex	Yes	Yes	No Bid	n/a	\$24,750.00	7-10 business days	Tronex		
Unipak Corporation	Yes	Yes	No Bid	n/a	\$54,000.00	1-15 days	Generic		
United Sales USA Corp	Yes	Yes	\$41,351.10	5 business days	\$26,790.00	5 business days	Emerald		
Uweport LLC	Yes	Yes	No Bid	n/a	\$31,500.00	7 days	UBLUE	*Prompt Payment discount of 2% if paid within 10 days	\$30,870.00

