Grand Junction

BID RECAP

SOLICITATION TITLE:
SOLICITATION NUMBER:

Nursery Stock
IFB-5282-23-KH

€O LG R4 DO OPENING DATE: 8/21/2023
OPENING TIME: 2:00 PM
PROJECT MANAGER: Rob Davis
BUYER NAME: Kassy Hackett
Container Trees Drum Laced Trees 1.75-3 inch Balled in Burlap
Small 12510 | Small1.25t
1.5inch MAX | 1> 1ch MAX
Vendor's | Vendor's Cost for Cost for Cost for Cost for Cost for Cost for o Balled in Burlap . Cost per Caliper
" " Acki I - - -
Company Bid Form | Bid Form :d;Z:di‘#‘]id Container #7 - | Container #15 - | Container #25 - | Container #7 - | Container #15 - | Container #25 - Bag?:[:;ai;:ap Drumlaced C::]séhp-ers(fgl:/;\)/er Inch - Cos!s;l)_ecgvliloot C;'T’;\‘;TI;ZOR% Comments
(Part 1) (Part 2) SLow SLow SLow STANDARD STANDARD STANDARD Cost per Caliper Cost per Caliper STANDARD
Inch -
Inch - SLOW | stANDARD
McKay Nursery Company Yes Yes Yes No Bid $155.00 $170.00 No Bid $145.00 $160.00 $150.00 $150.00 $160.00 $160.00 No Bid No Bid
Balled in Burlap Only. No
Schichtel's Nursery, Inc. Yes Yes Yes $145.00 $180.00 $210.00 $145.00 $180.00 $210.00 $165.00 $165.00 $202.00 $202.00 $202.00 $202.00 Drum Laced.
| SuperTrees Colorado LLC Yes Yes Yes $130.00 $180.00 $280.00 $130.00 $180.00 $280.00 $260.00 $260.00 $290.00 $290.00 No Bid No Bid
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