Bid Tabulation Fire Protection Equipment and System Inspection Services RFQ-5377-24-DD

Excel Fire Protection - Grand Junction, CO

Tech Electronics - Thornton, CO

High Desert Fire Protection LLC - Fruita, CO

Catergory 1 Fire Alarm Systems Annual 3-Year 5-Year Annual 3-Year 5-Year Annual | 3-Year 5-Year
City Hall $810.00) $1,100.00 $3,234.00 $5,390.00)
Facilities N/A $730.00 $2,145.00 $3,575.00)
City Offices $425.00) $795.00 $2,337.00 $3,895.00)
GJ Child Care Center N/A $860.00 $2,616.00 $3,360.00)
Fire Administration $425.00) $975.00 $2,865.00 $4,775.00)
Fire Station One $510.00 $1,030.00 $3,030.00 $5,050.00)
Fire Station Two $510.00) $1,150.00 $3,381.00 $5,635.00)
Fire Station Three $510.00 $1,250.00 $3,675.00 $6,125.00)
Fire Station Four $510.00 $1,065.00 $3,132.00 $5,220.00)
Fire Station Five $595.00 $1,225.00 $3,600.00 $6,000.00) No Bid
Fire Station Six $510.00 $1,265.00 $3,720.00 $6,200.00)
Fire Station Eight $595.00 $1,125.00 $3,309.00 $5,515.00)
Public Safety Building - Primary System $2,040.00! $3,175.00 $9,336.00! $15,560.00f
Public Safety Building - Dispatch Dry System Included in Above! Included in Above Included in Above [Included in Above
Las Colonias Amphitheater $325.00] $750.00| $2,205.00! $3,675.00
Stadium $765.00) $1,785.00 $5,250.00 $8,750.00)
Rood Aveue Parking Garage $350.00] $965.00| $2,835.00! $4,725.00
Orchard Mesa Pool N/A $915.00| $2,715.00! $4,525.00
Tiara Rado Golf Clubhouse $400.00| $1,025.00 $3,015.00 $5,025.00)
Total $9,280.00 $21,185.00 $62,400.00 $103,000.00)
Category 2 Sprinkler Systems Annual 3-Year 5-Year Annual 3-Year 5-Year Annual 3-Year 5-Year
City Hall $745.00) $300.00 $900.00 $1,500.00) $375.00] $650.00| $650.00)
Facilities $325.00) $200.00 $600.00) $1,000.00) N/A
Fire Administration $325.00) $200.00 $600.00 $1,000.00] $250.00] $250.00] $500.00)
Fire Station One $325.00 $200.00 $600.00 $1,000.00] $250.00] $250.00] $500.00)
Fire Station Two $325.00) $500.00 $1,500.00 $2,500.00) $350.00] $625.00] $625.00)
Fire Station Three $325.00 $200.00 $600.00 $1,000.00] $250.00] $250.00} $500.00)
Fire Station Four $325.00 $200.00 $600.00 $1,000.00] $350.00] $625.00] $625.00)
Fire Station Five $325.00 $200.00 $600.00 $1,000.00) $250.00] $250.00] $500.00)
Fire Station Six $325.00 $200.00 $600.00 $1,000.00] $250.00] $250.00} $500.00)
Fire Station Eight $325.00 $200.00 $600.00 $1,000.00) $250.00] $250.00| $500.00)
Public Safety Building Primary System $325.00 $200.00 $600.00 $1,000.00) $375.00] $375.00| $750.00)
Public Safety Building Dispatch - Dry System $325.00 $400.00 $1,200.00 $2,000.00) $250.00] $625.00] $625.00)
Stadium $445.00) $300.00 $900.00 $1,500.00) $435.00] $825.00] $825.00)
Rood Avenue Parking Garage $445.00 $300.00 $900.00 $1,500.00) $225.00] $225.00| $550.00)
Total $5,210.00 $3,600.00] $10,800.00 $18,000.00 $3,860.00 $5,450.00 $7,650.00)
Catergory 3 Inert Gas Systems Annual 3-Year 5-Year Annual 3-Year 5-Year Annual 3-Year 5-Year
City Hall Server Room (First Floor) $250.00 $945.00| $2,835.00! $4,725.00
City Hall Server Room (Second Floor) $250.00 $945.00| $2,835.00 $4,725.00
City Hall UPS Room $250.00) $945.00 $2,835.00 $4,725.00) No Bid
Public Safety Building Server Room $250.00 $945.00| $2,835.00! $4,725.00
Public Safety Building Radio Room $250.00 $945.00| $2,835.00! $4,725.00
Public Safety Building UPS Room $250.00) $945.00 $2,835.00 $4,725.00)
Total $1,500.00 $5,670.00] $17,010.00 $28,350.00
Category 4 Fire t Annual 6 Year 12 Year Hydro Annual 6 Year 12 Year Hydro Annual Per Insp |3/5 Year Inspect
2.5LB ABC $9.00 $30.00! $45.00f $8.00 $38.00! $45.00|
5 LB ABC $9.00 $35.00! $50.00f $8.00 $44.00] $60.00}
10 LB ABC $9.00 $40.00! $65.00f $8.00 $52.00! $85.00f
20 LB ABC $9.00 $50.00! $75.00f $8.00 $65.00! $145.00]
2.5 LB Halotron $9.00 $125.00 $200.00) $8.00 $155.00 $235.00]
5 LB Halotron $9.00 $150.00 $250.00) $8.00 $190.00 $275.00] No Bid
51B CO2 $9.00 N/A N/A] $8.00 N/A $35.00f
10 LB CO2 $9.00 N/A N/A] $8.00 N/A $55.00f
15 LB CO2 $9.00 N/A N/A| $8.00 N/A $65.00f
6 Liter Wet Chemical (K) $9.00 N/A N/A] $8.00 N/A $205.00]
2.5 Gal. Water $9.00 N/A $250.00) $8.00 N/A $35.00f
Disposal Fee $9.00 N/A $110.00) $9.00 N/A
Total $108.00| $430.00| $1,045.00) $97.00 $544.00| $1,240.00)
Category 5 Kitchen Hoods Annual 3-Year 5-Year Annual 3-Year 5-Year Annual | 3-Year 5-Year
Lincoln Park Golf (1 Tank) $250.00] $345.00|
Stadium (1 Tank) $250.00 $345.00 No Bid
Tiara Rado Golf (1 Tank) $270.00] $345.00|
Total $770.00| $1,035.00]
Grand Total $16,868.00; $31,587.00 $3,860.00




