Bid Tabulation

cITY OF Solicitation Title: One (1) New 1.5-Ton 4 x 2 Regular Cab Dump Truck

Gran d l unction Solicitation Number: IFB-5696-25-KF
c<__

COLORADO Opening Date: June 26, 2025
PURCHASING DIVISION Opening Time: 2:30 p.m. Mountain Time
Purchasing Agent: Kathleen Franklin
) Warranty Info
Vendor Name Location C;mpleted Option 1 Option 2 Option 3 Year/Manufacturer/Model ey Provideyd in Caml ] Comments
id Form Days ARO[ . o Spec/Comp Form
Bid Submission
2026 Ford F550 4x2 Reg Cab / 2026
1|Custom Truck One Source, L.P. |Kansas City, MO Yes No Bid No Bid|  $109,264.00|Load King 11' Drop Side Dump 190-210 Yes Yes
2| Fremont Motor Company Lander, WY Yes $86,482.00 No Bid $95,798.00/2026 Ford F550 w/ Rugby 180-200 Yes Yes
3|McCandless Truck Center Grand Junction, CO Yes No Bid No Bid $98,694.00|2025-26 International CV515 180-270 Yes Yes
2026 Ford F-550 (F5G) 4x2 Reg Chas
4|Peoria Ford Peoria, AZ Yes $84,040.64 No Bid No Bid|Cab DRW 60-180 Yes Yes
5|Phil Long Ford of Denver Littleton, CO Yes No Bid No Bid $98.855.00/2025 Ford F-550 DRW 4x4 14 Yes Yes
Pine Country INC Grand Junction, CO Yes $77,354.88 No Bid $89,235.88|2025 Ford F-550 Oct-25 Yes Yes
36-1.25" Top x 1" Bottom pins 38-NTEA Class
Sheridan Motors Sheridan, WY Yes No Bid No Bid $93,020.00/2026 Ram 4500 4x2 Reqular Cab 1220-150 Yes Yes 40
| don't have a trusted CNG partner so | am not
Sill-TerHar Motors, Inc Broomfield, CO Yes $79,000.00 No Bid $90,000.00{2026 Ford F-450 180-240 Yes Yes bidding CNG.
#13 you have gray graphite, our color is dark ash
#24 you have black vinyl, ours is graphite #44
there are not any Chevy medium duty dealers
Transwest GMC Trucks Henderson, CO Yes No Bid No Bid $90,432.00|2025 Chevy Silverado 5500 250 Yes Yes located within 50 miles of Grand Junction
2026 Ram 4500 Regular Cab Chassis
10| Victory Motors of Craig Inc Craig, CO Yes $80.850.00 No Bid $90.450.00/4x2 84" CA 120 Yes Yes
Low Responsive
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