CITY O

Grand Junction
(""/C COLORADDZO

SOLICITATION TITLE:

Inmate Food Services

Solicitation Recap

SOLICITATION NUMBER:

RFP-3905-14-SH

MESA OPENING DATE: 10/29/2014
COU NTY OPENING TIME: 2:30 P.M.
BUYER: Susan Hyatt
Response |Addenda [Cover CPM (2800-3200 - ili i i
Form Lette CPM (2800-3200 Grilled Hamb Soup/Salad Bar |Chili Dogs/Chips |Pizza/Salad
Company " |cat) 3 hot meals [¢8) 2 hotmeals [Taco Bar CPM | uiheccpm |cpm CPM CPM
+ 1 cold meal
1{Tiger Correctional Services NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $
2| consolidated Correctional Food Service| NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $ $
3 CBM Managed Services Yes Yes Yes [31.115 $1.143 $3.50 $3.50 $3.50 $3.50 $3.50
4 Aramark Yes Yes Yes [%1.10-$165 |$1.10-$1.28 [$NoBid $No Bid $No Bid $No Bid $No Bid
5 ABL Management, Inc. Yes Yes Yes [$1.1021 $1.0902 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75
6 $ $ $ $ $ $ $
7 $ $ $ $ $ $ $
8 $ $ $ $ $ $ $
9 $ $ $ $ $ $ $
10 $ $ $ $ $ $ $
11 $ $ $ $ $ $ $
12 $ $ $ $ $ $ $
13 $ $ $ $ $ $ $
14 $ $ $ $ $ $ $
15 $ $ $ $ $ $ $
16 $ $ $ $ $ $ $
17 $ $ $ $ $ $ $
18 $ $ $ $ $ $ $
19 $ $ $ $ $ $ $
20 $ $ $ $ $ $ $
21 $ $ $ $ $ $ $
22 $ $ $ $ $ $ $
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