
 
Grand Junction, Colorado 

 
July 31 1925 

 
All the Councilmen being duly notified the City Council of the City of 
Grand Junction met in special session at 6:00 o'clock P.M., with President 
Bell presiding. Those present and answering at roll call were Councilmen: 
President of the Council Dr. J.E. Bell, H.O. Bear, O.H. Ellison, F.W. 
Logsden, W.E. Meders, C.D. Moslander& D.B. Short, City Manager 
Thompson, City Clerk Fred A Peck, and City Attorney Hinman. 
 
W.L. Downing presented plans of a building he desired to erect at 12St. & 
Gunnison Avenue, the same to be used as a service & filling station. 
Councilman Bear moved, seconded by Councilman Short that W.L. 
Downing be granted a permit to erect a service & filling station on Lots 18-
19-20, Block 44. Motion carried. 
 
Councilman D.B. Short introduced an ordinance entitled "AN 
ORDINANCE CALLING A SPECIAL ELECTION AND PROVIDING 
FOR THE SUBMISSION TO THE VOTE OF THE QUALIFIED 
TAXPAYING ELECTORS OF THE CITY OF GRAND JUNCTION, 
COLORADO, THE QUESTION OF AUTHORIZING THE CITY 
COUNCIL OF SAID CITY TO ISSUE THE NEGOTIABLE COUPON 
BONDS OF THE CITY FOR THE PURPOSE OF PAYING THE COST 
OF PAVING STREET AND ALLEY INTERSECTIONS IN SAID CITY, 
AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY" which ordinance was thereupon 
read in full. 
 
It was then moved by Councilman W.E. Meders, and seconded by 
Councilman C.D. Moslander, that all rules of the Council which might 
prevent, unless suspended, the final passage and adoption of said ordinance 
at this meeting, be and the same are hereby suspended, for the purpose of 
permitting the final passage and adoption of said ordinance at this meeting. 
 
The question being upon the adoption of said motion and the suspension of 



the rules, the roll was called, with the following result: 
 
Those voting aye: Councilmen H.O. Bear, O.H. Ellison, F.W. Logsden, 
W.E. Meders, C.D. Moslander, D.B. Short & Dr. J.E. Bell. 
 
Those voting NAY: None. 
 
All the members of the city Council having voted in favor of said motion, 
the President declared said motion carried and the rules suspended. 
 
Councilman F.W. Logsden then moved that said ordinance be now placed 
upon its final passage. 
 
Councilman H.O. Bear seconded the motion. 
 
The question being upon the placing of said ordinance upon its final 
passage, the roll was called, with the following result: 
 
Those voting aye: Councilmen H.O. Bear, O.H. Ellison, F.W. Logsden, 
W.E. Meders, C.D. Moslander, D.B. Short & Dr. J.E. Bell. 
 
Those voting nay: None. 
 
The presiding officer, then declared the motion carried and the ordinance 
placed upon its final passage. 
 
Councilman Moslander thereupon moved that said ordinance be finally 
passed and adopted as introduced and read. Councilman H.O. Bear 
seconded the motion. 
 
The question being upon the final passage and adoption of said ordinance, 
the roll was called, with the following result: 
 
Those voting aye: Councilmen H.O. Bear, O.H. Ellison, F.W. Logsden, 
W.E. Meders, C.D. Moslander, D.B. Short & Dr. J.E. Bell. 
 



Those voting nay: none. 
 
The presiding officer thereupon declared that all the members of the City 
Council, duly elected, qualified and acting as such, having voted in favor 
thereof, the said motion was carried and said ordinance finally passed and 
adopted. 
 
On motion duly adopted, it was then ordered that said ordinance be 
numbered 389; that said ordinance after approval by the President, be 
published in the Daily Sentinel the official newspaper of the City, in it's 
issue of August 1st, 1925; and said ordinance be recorded and 
authenticated as required by law. 
 
Councilman Moslander moved, seconded by Councilman Short that G.V. 
Fox be employed as deputy City Clerk during the registration period for the 
special City election to be held on August 18th 1925. Motion carried. 
 
Councilman Logsden moved, seconded by Councilman Meders that the 
City Clerk be instructed to publish the following election notice. Motion 
carried. 
 

ELECTION NOTICE 
 
City of Grand Junction, Colorado. 
 
Notice of Special Municipal Election to be Held on Tuesday, the 18th day 
of August, A.D. 1925. 
Public Notice is hereby given that 
a special municipal election will be held on Tuesday, the 18th day of 
August, A. D. 1925, at the polling places hereinafter designated in the City 
of Grand Junction, Colorado, as follows: 
 
District A, City Voting Precinct 9, Polling Place, City Hall. 
 
District B, City Voting Precinct 10, Polling Place, Western Slope Garage. 
 



District C, City Voting Precinct 11, Polling Place Y. M. C. A. 
District D, City Voting Precinct 12, Polling Place, 701 Main Street. 
District E, City Voting Precinct 16, Polling Place, Christian Church. 
Upon the date and at the time designated aforesaid, the polls will be open 
from the hour of 7 o/clock a.m. to and including and will be closed at the 
hour of 7 o’clock p.m.  The ballots to be used in voting upon the questions 
submitted will be prepared and furnished by the City Clerk to the Judges of 
the election, to be by them furnished to the voters.  The election will be 
held and conducted; as nearly as may be, in the manner prescribed by law 
in the case of elections for municipal officers. Registration for the said 
election will take place in the manner now provided by law. 
 
That at said election the following proposed ordinances will be submitted to 
the qualified electors of the City of Grand Junction, Colorado, for their 
adoption or rejection: 
 
First, an ordinance entitled: 
 
"An Ordinance Providing for the, Assistance by the City of Grand Junction 
in the Purchase of a Site for the Junior College of Grand Junction, 
Colorado, and Providing for an Appropriation. Therefor.” 
Second, an Ordinance entitled:  “An Ordinance Concerning the Vacating of 
a Portion of South Seventh Street, in the City of Grand Junction, Colorado, 
and the Selling Thereof to the Adjoining Property Owners.” 
In Witness Whereof the City Council of the City of Grand Junction has 
caused this notice to be published and posted as required by law, and dated 
this first day of August, A.D. 1925. 
By Order of the City Council. 
   Fred A. Peck, City Clerk 
 
There being no further business to come before the meeting, the Council 
adjourned upon motion of Councilman Meders, seconded by Councilman 
Bear. 
 
/s/ Fred A. Peck 
________ 



City Clerk 


