
 
 
 

MAYOR’S INTRODUCTION AND WELCOME 
 

 

7:00 COUNCILMEMBER REPORTS 
            
7:15 CITY MANAGER’S REPORT 
 
7:20 REVIEW OF FUTURE WORKSHOP AGENDAS    Attach W-1 
 
7:25 CITY-OWNED PROPERTY ADJACENT TO TIARA RADO:  Discussion 

on including 80 acres of City-owned property adjacent to Tiara Rado in a 
Growth Amendment application. 

 
7:35 REVIEW WEDNESDAY COUNCIL AGENDA 
 
7:40    PLANNING QUARTERLY UPDATE      Attach W-2 

           
7:55 NORTH AVENUE CORRIDOR PLAN:  Discussion of the draft plan and 

specifically implementation strategies.  Phase One of the North Avenue 
Corridor is defined as North Avenue from 12th Street east to I-70 Business 
Loop.             Attach W-3 

 
8:40 ANNUAL BUFFER PROGRAM UPDATE: Mesa Land Trust will present 

their annual update.         
                 

 
ADJOURN 

      
 
 
 
 

 
   
 

 
GRAND JUNCTION CITY COUNCIL 

WORKSHOP AGENDA  
 

MONDAY, JULY 16, 2007, 7:00 PM  
CITY HALL AUDITORIUM, 250 N. 5TH STREET 



 

Attach W-1 
Future Workshop Agendas 
 
 

 

(December 19, 2011) 

 

JULY 2007 

 

 JULY 30, MONDAY 11:30 AM: Two Rivers Convention Center 

11:30 CHAMBER OF COMMERCE LUNCHEON: With their board  

 

 JULY 30, MONDAY 5:00 PM: Administration Conference Room 

5:00 BUDGET WORKSHOP 

 

JULY 30, MONDAY 7:00 PM: City Hall Auditorium 

7:00 COUNCIL REPORTS, REVIEW WEDNESDAY AGENDA AND FUTURE 

WORKSHOP AGENDAS 

7:25 CITY MANAGER’S REPORT 

7:30 ENERGY CONSERVATION – Alpine Bank & City Energy Conservation Committee  

8:20 EMS ANNUAL UPDATE 

 

AUGUST 2007  

 

AUGUST 2, THURSDAY, 7:00 PM, City Hall Auditorium  

7:00 ANNUAL PERSIGO MEETING 

 

AUGUST 13, MONDAY 11:30 AM: GJEP BOARD ROOM, 122 N. 6TH STREET 

11:30 GJEP LUNCHEON:  With their board 

 

 AUGUST 13, MONDAY 5:00 PM: Administration Conference Room 

5:00 BUDGET WORKSHOP 

 

AUGUST 13, MONDAY 7:00 PM: City Hall Auditorium 

7:00 COUNCIL REPORTS, REVIEW WEDNESDAY AGENDA AND FUTURE 

WORKSHOP AGENDAS 

7:25 CITY MANAGER’S REPORT 

7:30 I-70 CORRIDOR GROUP/ROCKY MOUNTAIN RAIL AUTHORITY UPDATE: Dr. 

Flo Raitano (I-70 Corridor) and Harry Dale (RMRA) 

8:15 HOUSING MARKET ANALYSIS DONE BY CHFA:  Jim Coil (see report  

at http://www.colohfa.org/documents/GrandJunctionRpt-0107.pdf)  & Jody  

Kole  

 

SEPTEMBER 2007 

 

 

 

SEPTEMBER 17, MONDAY 11:30 AM: PERSIGO WASTEWATER TREATMENT 

PLANT 

11:30 PRESENTATION OF EPA CLEAN WATER ACT AWARD 

11:40 BUDGET WORKSHOP 

 

SEPTEMBER 3, 2007 – WORKSHOPS CANCELED - LABOR DAY 

 

 

http://www.colohfa.org/documents/GrandJunctionRpt-0107.pdf


 

 

 SEPTEMBER 17, MONDAY 5:00 PM: Administration Conference Room 

5:00 BUDGET WORKSHOP 

 

SEPTEMBER 17, MONDAY 7:00 PM: City Hall Auditorium 

7:00 COUNCIL REPORTS, REVIEW WEDNESDAY AGENDA AND FUTURE 

WORKSHOP AGENDAS 

7:25 CITY MANAGER’S REPORT 

7:30 211 TELEPHONE SERVICE - desire to market and keep viable, strategic plan 

outlining services 

8:15    ELECTRONIC RECORDS STORAGE INITIATIVE:  Update on how City Staff 

proposes to deal with electronic records and e-discovery issues 

 

OCTOBER 2007 

 

OCTOBER 1, MONDAY 11:30 AM: ADMINISTRATION CONFERENCE ROOM 

11:30 OPEN (BUDGET WORKSHOP?) 

 

OCTOBER 1, MONDAY 7:00 PM: City Hall Auditorium 

7:00 COUNCIL REPORTS, REVIEW WEDNESDAY AGENDA AND FUTURE 

WORKSHOP AGENDAS 

7:25 CITY MANAGER’S REPORT 

7:30 OPEN 

 

OCTOBER 15, MONDAY 11:30 AM: ADMINISTRATION CONFERENCE ROOM 

11:30 OPEN 

 

OCTOBER 15, MONDAY 7:00 PM: City Hall Auditorium 

7:00 COUNCIL REPORTS, REVIEW WEDNESDAY AGENDA AND FUTURE 

WORKSHOP AGENDAS 

7:25 CITY MANAGER’S REPORT 

7:30 OPEN 

 

NOVEMBER 2007 

 

NOVEMBER 5, MONDAY 11:30 AM: ADMINISTRATION CONFERENCE ROOM 

11:30 OPEN 

 

NOVEMBER 5, MONDAY 7:00 PM: City Hall Auditorium 

7:00 COUNCIL REPORTS, REVIEW WEDNESDAY AGENDA AND FUTURE 

WORKSHOP AGENDAS 

7:25 CITY MANAGER’S REPORT 

7:30 OPEN 

 

 
 BIN LIST  

 

1. AMENDMENT TO SMOKING ORDINANCE – Request from VFW   

2. MEET WITH ABC: Luncheon – TBD  

3. REVIEW PROPERTY INVENTORY – Sept. 17 lunch? 

4.   URBAN TRAILS PILOT PROJECT 



 

 

Attach W-2 
Planning Quarterly Update 

CITY OF GRAND JUNCTION 
 

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA 

Subject 
Quarterly Update from the Planning Division of the Public 
Works & Planning Department 

Meeting Date July 16, 2007 

Date Prepared July 11, 2007 File # N/A 

Author Lisa Cox Planning Manager 

Presenter Name Lisa Cox Planning Manager 

Report results back 
to Council 

 Yes X No When  

Citizen Presentation   Yes X  No Name  

X Workshop  Formal Agenda  Consent  
Individual 
Consideration 

 
Summary: In an effort to keep City Council informed of the significant activities and 
issues that the Planning Division of the Public Works and Planning Department are 
involved in, quarterly updates will be provided for discussion with Council. 
 
Budget: N/A 
 
Action Requested/Recommendation: Discussion of items that are of interest to City 
Council.   
 
Attachments:  N/A 
 
Background Information: In February, 2007, the Community Development 
Department was involved in a significant reorganization of several City departments and 
workgroups in an effort to gain greater efficiencies and to provide better customer 
service to the public. The Community Development Department became the Planning 
Division of the newly formed Public Works and Planning Department.  This is first 
quarterly update since the reorganization.  
 



 

 

The Planning Division is responsible for review of current development proposals, long 
range planning activities such as the upcoming Comprehensive Plan, area and corridor 
plans, issuance of fence permits and Planning Clearances.  Assistance is provided to 
the general public and development community with questions concerning zoning and 
land use issues on a daily basis.   
 
With a robust economy and growing demand for planning services, the Planning 
Division workgroup is committed to providing a high level of customer service.  The 
following topics illustrate a few of the ways that we provide that service. 
 
Communication 
 
Effective communication is key to our success and we work hard to keep the lines of 
communication open.  It‟s important to our workgroup to provide the highest level of 
service to our community, and good communication is an essential component of that 
service.   
 
Each quarter, a newsletter is sent out to the development community to keep them 
informed of important planning issues.  Topics covered in the newsletter include 
monthly and yearly statistics on building and development permits, recently approved 
subdivisions, the status of planning studies and projects, information on special 
programs such as the Infill/Redevelopment Program and the Site Design Exception 
process, and contact information for staff if citizens have any questions. 
 
Phone calls and emails are returned or responded to within 24 hours whenever 
possible.  In addition to General meetings and Pre-Application conferences, we make a 
point to be available to meet with applicants during the development review process to 
resolve issues and answer questions directly about review comments or development 
issues. 
 
Education 
 
Many of the services that the Planning Division provides are described in informational 
brochures.  Due to recent organizational and Code changes, several of these brochures 
are being updated to provide current information to the public and our customers.  
These brochures provide easy to understand information about planning services and 
how to get started in the process. 
 
“Planning 101” is a new educational program that is currently being developed that will 
enable us to explain the basic “how to‟s” of planning to interested citizens.  This course 
is being designed for presentation to both a layperson and a member of the professional 
development community.  And in an effort to reach as many citizens as possible, we 
hope to make this course available both at City Hall and out in the community to civic 
groups or other interested citizens. 
 



 

 

Keeping our planners, engineers and technicians informed of current planning trends 
and issues is essential.  Regular in-house training takes place almost every week in the 
Planning Division.  When an opportunity to attend a regional or national training event 
occurs, peer-to-peer training is then held within our workgroup so that planners can 
share that information and training with their peers.   
 
Community Outreach 
 
As a workgroup, we are continually working to build bridges and create partnerships 
with our community.  We feel this is the best way to work together as we build our 
community.  One of the ways we accomplish this is to meet each month with the 
Chamber of Commerce Planning Oversight Committee.  The results of customer service 
surveys are discussed at these meetings as well as other suggestions for ways to 
improve service.  During these meetings, staff has an opportunity each month to hear 
about issues of concern from the Oversight Committee and to keep the Chamber 
updated on current planning events and issues. 
 
In addition to meeting with the Chamber of Commerce each month, we also meet 
regularly with a citizen focus group.  The focus group is composed primarily of members 
from the professional development community.  Topics discussed with the focus group 
include possible amendments to the Zoning and Development Code, possible changes 
in development fees and policies, and new ideas about how to streamline the 
development review process. 
 
Planners also attend Neighborhood Meetings on a regular basis as part of the pre-
submittal requirements of the Zoning and Development Code.  Although these meetings 
are usually required for new development proposals and are facilitated and run by 
potential developers or their representatives, they are also a great opportunity for us to 
answer citizens questions about the City and/or the annexation and development 
process. 
 
Current Projects 
 
The Planning Division has accepted 196 development applications to date.  Although 
this represents 25 fewer projects than June of last year, the time to review and approve 
projects takes longer in many cases with current applications due to the project 
complexity.  Most of the flat, easy to develop parcels in our community have already 
been developed.  This leaves property with access restrictions, physical and 
topographical constraints, parcels encumbered by floodplain or with drainage issues, 
and/or smaller parcels that must be combined to develop.  In addition, many parcels 
require a Growth Plan amendment or rezone prior to actual site or subdivision approval 
which adds to the complexity and time that it takes to develop. 
 
As development applications become more complicated and complex, the time it takes 
to review and approve development applications increases.  Technical traffic impact 
studies, geotechnical soils reports, drainage analysis studies, hillside and slope 



 

 

calculations must all be carefully reviewed in addition to site surveys, detailed 
engineering plans and final plats.   
 
While there is significant pressure on the Planning Division to review and approve 
development applications, it is equally important to balance to needs of the community 
and requirements of the City‟s development regulations with the growing demand for an 
expeditious review of projects.  Projects with potentially significant community impacts 
such as the St. Mary‟s Hospital Century Project, a 12-story tower addition to the existing 
main hospital building, requires an investment of many hours of review by planners and 
engineers before it can be recommended for approval. 
 
Planning Division staff 
 
The reorganization in February, 2007, brought with it many changes in personnel.  In 
addition to new management, the Planning Division has recently had two staff members 
resign and one transfer to another City workgroup.  Every effort has been made to 
recruit qualified personnel to fill the vacancies, however this has been challenging.  The 
development review process is delayed when vacancies are not able to be filled for 
several months.   
 
The recruitment of qualified engineer‟s and planners has proven to be difficult.  Over the 
past 12 months, the number of qualified applicants available to fill vacancies within the 
Department has steadily declined.  In an effort to provide our customers with timely, 
quality reviews, we entered into a contract with the consulting firm Carter / Burgess to 
provide engineering reviews of new development applications.  Beginning in February, 
Carter / Burgess staff from Denver have attend our weekly meetings and provided 
written comments for new developments.  We have also discussed the possibility of 
contracting planning services and reviews with Winston Associates, the firm retained to 
assist with the development of our Comprehensive Plan.   Along with Mesa County 
staff, who are experiencing similar challenges filling vacant positions, we have 
discussed a number of possible long term solutions including sharing consulting 
services, and working with Mesa State College to develop programs locally to train 
engineers and planners.   
 
The Planning Division has experienced some success recently in filled several vacant 
positions including a Development Engineer, Senior Planner and Planning Services 
Supervisor  and we hope to fill a vacant Planning Technician position in the near future.  
This would bring the Division up to full staffing and allow implementation of the 
Development Review Team concept.  We see many benefits to using a Development 
Team approach when reviewing development proposals and are anxious to implement 
this tool. 
 
With the upcoming Comprehensive Plan and the growing demands of our robust 
economy, it is essential that we maintain adequate staffing levels to ensure that we are 
meeting the City‟s obligations to its citizens and community. 
 



 

 

Moving forward 
 
The Planning Division is working hard everyday to meet the needs of our community.  
Our planners, engineers and technicians continually strive to provide outstanding 
customer service.  This is no easy task with a growing demand for planning services 
and the need to invest more and more time in the review of ever more complex 
development applications. 
 
Work on the South Downtown Plan continues.  Public input has been solicited in an 
earlier open house meeting and another open house is scheduled for early August.  We 
expect to complete this important plan by Fall of this year. 
 
Exciting work on the City‟s first Comprehensive Plan will begin in early August.  This is 
the most ambitious planning activity that the City has undertaken since completion of 
the Persigo Agreement and Growth Plan in the late 1990‟s.  The Planning Division has 
already begun work on pre-planning activities in anticipation of working with our 
consultant, Winston Associates, in August.  We are very excited about the many 
opportunities to partner with our Grand Valley community to accomplish this important 
plan. 
 
Large subdivisions and mixed use projects such as the Red Rocks Valley Subdivision 
and Corner Square development are continually being reviewed and approved.  In 
addition to the larger developments, we are processing a significant number of 
applications related to the energy industry as well as retail and commercial 
developments.  Complex projects such as the new St. Mary‟s Hospital Century Tower 
have also recently been approved, as well as several Conditional Use Permits, rezone 
applications and site plan reviews.  In 2007, we fully expect to meet or exceed the 400 
development applications that were processed in calendar year 2006. 
 
 
 
 
 



 

 

Attach W-3 
North Avenue Corridor Plan  

CITY OF GRAND JUNCTION 
 

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA 

Subject North Avenue Corridor Plan, Phase One 

Meeting Date July 16, 2007 

Date Prepared July 12, 2007 File # 

Author Kathy Portner Neighborhood Services Manager 

Presenter Name 
Kathy Portner 
Steve Wilensky 

Neighborhood Services Manager 
EDAW 

Report results back 
to Council 

X No  Yes When  

Citizen Presentation   Yes X  No Name  

   X Workshop  Formal Agenda  Consent  
Individual 
Consideration 

 
Summary: Presentation of draft North Avenue Corridor Plan for the corridor from 12th 
Street to I-70 Business Loop.  Staff and the EDAW consultant team will present the draft 
plan and seek input on implementation strategies. 
 
Budget: $100,000—already budgeted and approved. 
 
Action Requested/Recommendation:  Council input and direction on the draft plan, 
specifically the implementation strategies. 
 
Attachments:  Draft Plan (A bound hard copy is also in your mail box) 
 
Background Information: Elements such as age, dilapidated structures, and high 
turnover in area businesses along North Avenue have contributed to its deterioration.  
Being primarily zoned for commercial use has resulted in sporadic disinvestment, 
underutilized buildings, old strip malls, and vacant property.  Phase One of the 
proposed plan includes North Avenue from 12th Street east to I-70B.   
 
A draft plan has been completed based on input received from two public open houses, 
both of which were well attended.  The plan includes an overall strategy to revitalize the 
corridor, primarily focusing on sustaining and increasing vitality.   The proposed plan 
includes specific key projects and strategies for the implementation of improvements 
and future investment opportunities that will stabilize the corridor and provide land uses 
to: 

 Fill a „market gap‟ in the region 

 Create services at the neighborhood level 

 Restore the regional destination desire 



 

 

 Improve mobility for pedestrians, bicyclists and transit riders 

 Create a significant „neighborhood‟ of residential, retail, commercial and public 
activity areas 

 
An important component of the plan is the market conditions analysis.  Based on market 
demand, and assuming quality design, land assemblage assistance, regulatory 
improvements and development incentives, the North Avenue corridor could absorb the 
following projected demand over the next ten years: 

 200 apartment units and 140 single family attached units 

 240,000 to 325,000 square feet of new retail space 

 95,000 square feet of new office space 
 
The recommended preferred alternative includes the following elements: 

 A student and entertainment district in proximity to Mesa State College providing 
student housing and after 5 activities 

 Senior housing located in proximity to a quality grocer and neighborhood retail 

 A multi-family and attached residential district connecting the neighborhoods to 
the north, and potential for office space to the south 

 A mixed use area with residential, office and retail incorporated with civic and 
public spaces to create a gateway for the 29 Road intersection 

 Regional retail 
 
Recommended implementation strategies include: 

 Urban renewal district, business improvement district or other financing district to 
assist with on-site and off-site costs 

 Land assemblage assistance—land swaps, low-interest loans, acquisition/write-
downs 

 Marketing opportunities  

 A catalyst project 

 An overlay zone for the corridor that addresses building setbacks, landscaping, 
signage, and site design 

 Link parking lots, minimize curb cuts and consolidate driveways 

 Create street sections that include pedestrian access and standardized 
landscaping, lighting and street furniture 

 Work with private and non-profit interests to provide opportunities for residential 
development 

 Create incentives for redevelop along the corridor that is consistent with the plan 
 
Next Steps 
 
The draft plan will be made available for public comment through August, with adoption 
hearings before the Planning Commission and City Council in September and October.  
 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 



 

 

 



 

 

 
 


