
SOLICITATION NUMBER:
OPENING DATE:
OPENING TIME:
PROJECT MANAGER:
BUYER NAME:

Acknowledged 
Addenda 1

Bidder's Bid 
Form

Price Bid 
Form

Item 1 - 
Streets

Item 2 - 
Streets

Item 3 - 
Streets

Item 1 - 
Water

Item 2 - 
Water

Item 3 - 
Water Item A Item B Item C Item D

Item E - 
Class 6

Item E - 
Class 5 Item F Item G Item H Comments

N/A Yes Yes No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

N/A Yes Yes No Bid $13.50 No Bid $8.50 $7.75 $7.75 $9.00 $11.50 $11.00 $11.50 No Bid $6.50

N/A Yes Yes No Bid $11.15 No Bid $7.15 $7.15 $7.15 $7.45 $7.45 $7.15 $7.45 No Bid No Bid

N/A Yes Yes $16.50 $12.75 $16.50 $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 $8.25 $8.25 $8.00 $8.25 $12.00 $8.35

N/A Yes Yes No Bid $13.25 $15.29 $8.10 $5.00 $5.00 $8.50 No Bid No Bid $12.00 No Bid No Bid

N/A Yes Yes No Bid $10.90 No Bid $9.50 $5.90 $5.90 $9.75 $10.50 $10.00 $10.50 No Bid No Bid

See Bidder's 
Exceptions/Sp
ecial 
Conditions.

City Awards

Mesa County Awards

Apparent Low:

Amount:

Grand Junction Pipe & Supply

Parkerson Construction

Whitewater Building Materials

2/25/2015

3:00pm

Duane Hoff Jr.

Company

City of Grand Junction Pricing Mesa County Pricing

Moores Mining 

United Companies

Upland Companies

BID RECAP
SOLICITATION TITLE: Aggregate & Road Material 2015

IFB-4002-15-DH

Dan Thorne/Heather Conger


