Grand Junction

MESA
COUNTY

BID RECAP

SOLICITATION TITLE:

Mesa County Asphalt Crack Fill, Seal Coat & Stip Project 2015

SOLICITATION NUMBER:

IFB-4020-15-DH

OPENING DATE: 3/19/2015
OPENING TIME: 3:00pm
PROJECT MANAGER: Greg Linza

BUYER NAME:

Duane Hoff Jr.

AM-PM SWEEPERS AND STRIPES

Acknowledged Addenda 1 Contrsgtrcr)\”rls o Atltjerr?dilrgjce Lot Name Crack Fill Seal Coat Striping Patch Work
YES YES YES Central Services $1,500.00 $4,080.20 $800.00 &\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\&
Sheriff Office Total: $1,400.00 $11,000.00 $2,500.00 &\\\\\\\\\\\\&
Justice Center Total: $3,800.00 $14,800.00 $5,200.00 &\\\\\\\\\\\\&
Criminal Justice Center Total: | $900.00 | $3,288.00 | $1,100.00 | $900.00 |
Courthouse Lot | $200.00 | $1,000.00 | $300.00 AAAAAANN
GVT Downtown Transfer Station | $200.00 | $1,000.00 | $400.00 AN
GVT Clifton Transfer Station | $800.00 | $2,000.00 | $600.00 AN
Long Family Memorial Park Total: | $1,800.00 | $5,560.00 | $1,600.00 &\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\N
Clifton Community Center | $300.00 | $5,000.00 | $250.00 AAAAAAAANN
Fairgrounds Total: | $2,500.00 |  $37,000.00 | $3,900.00 | $1,000.00 |

ARMOR PROSEAL

Acknowledged Addenda 1 | Contractor's Bid Form Attendance Lot Name Crack Fill Seal Coat Striping Patch Work
YES YES YES Central Services $2,100.00 $6,960.00 $520.00 AN
Sheriff Office Total: | $4,300.00 | $12,533.00 | $650.00 AN
Justice Center Total: | $4,300.00 | $22,500.00 | $2,380.00 NN\
Criminal Justice Center Total: | $500.00 | $4,550.00 | $340.00 | $350.00 |
Courthouse Lot | $460.00 | $1,450.00 | $240.00 AAAAAAANNN
GVT Downtown Transfer Station | $320.00 | $1,450.00 | $225.00 AAAAAAN
GVT Clifton Transfer Station | $220.00 | $2,900.00 | $400.00 AN
Long Family Memorial Park Total: | $5,310.00 |  $26,460.00 | $2,260.00 NN\
Clifton Community Center | $1,200.00 | $2,400.00 | $280.00 AAAAAAAAANN
Fairgrounds Total: | $7,000.00 |  $45,900.00 | $3,580.00 | $380.00 |

ASPHALT SPECIALISTS AND SUPPLY

Acknowledged Addenda 1 | Contractor's Bid Form Attendance Lot Name Crack Fill Seal Coat Striping Patch Work
Yes NO YES Central Services $1,290.00 $3,382.00 $325.00 AN
NOTE: They did not Sheriff Office Total: | $3,375.00 | $6,052.00 | $1,073.00 A\
provide thelr Contractor's Justice Center Total: [ $421500] 51013500 | $2,750.00 P
have the addendum Criminal Justice Center Total: | $900.00 | $2,126.00 | $510.00 | $300.00 |
a.kr?]?swlfsvngzp \tN'Qg I:Jed;jd' Courthouse Lot | $345.00 | $707.00 | $220.00 AN
;:::)ov\\/lfvi ?ttthh:ytzji;jd%p;ﬁ;g% GVT Downtown Transfer Station | $405.00 | $705.00 | $150.00 AAAAAAANN
acknowledge the GVT Clifton Transfer Station | $300.00 | $1,416.00 | $250.00 AAAAAAANN
. :gﬁ::gm ;n V;ZE ;c:;efsé r Long Family Memorial Park Total: | $3,030.00 |  $12,487.00 | $2,435.00 NN\
electronic submittals. Clifton Community Center | $450.00 | $1,160.00 | $200.00 AN
Fairgrounds Total: | $7,035.00 |  $23,930.00 | $5,775.00 | $300.00 |

$0.00
P&H EQUIPMENT

Acknowledged Addenda 1 | Contractor's Bid Form Attendance Lot Name Crack Fill Seal Coat Striping Patch Work
NO NO YES Central Services $1,917.00 $4,160.00 $395.00 AN
Sheriff Office Total: | $4,044.00 | $7,427.00 | $1,1770.00 AN
Justice Center Total: | $6,176.00 |  $13,407.00 | $2,920.00 AN
Criminal Justice Center Total: | $1,250.00 | $2,723.00 | $585.00 |No Bid |
Courthouse Lot | $398.00 | $863.00 | ZZZZ A nm
GVT Downtown Transfer Station | $398.00 | $860.00 | $185.00 AAAAAN
GVT Clifton Transfer Station | $795.00 | $1,727.00 | $295.00 AAAAAAAAN
Long Family Memorial Park Total: | $7,246.00 |  $15,724.00 | $2,595.00. AN
Clifton Community Center | $655.00 | $1,420.00 | $240.00 AAAAAAAANN
Fairgrounds Total: |  $23,112.00|  $29,072.00 | $6,295.00 |No bid |

SEALCO INC.

Acknowledged Addenda 1 | Contractor's Bid Form Attendance Lot Name Crack Fill Seal Coat Striping Patch Work
YES YES YES Central Services $3,000.00 $6,500.00 $1,000.00 AN
Sheriff Office Total: | $5,000.00 |  $12,500.00 | $1,500.00 AN
Justice Center Total: | $9,000.00 |  $20,500.00 | $4,800.00 AN\
Criminal Justice Center Total: | $3,000.00 | $3,200.00 | $1,000.00 | $500.00 |
Courthouse Lot | $1,000.00 | $1,500.00 | $300.00 AAAAAAANN
GVT Downtown Transfer Station | $1,000.00 | $1,500.00 | $500.00 AN
GVT Clifton Transfer Station | $1,000.00 | $3,000.00 | $300.00 AAAAAANN
Long Family Memorial Park Total: | $6,000.00 |  $21,800.00 | $2,900.00 AN\
Clifton Community Center | $1,000.00 | $2,500.00 | $300.00 AN
Fairgrounds Total: |  $22,500.00 |  $42,000.00 | $7,900.00 | $1,000.00 |




Rocky Mountain E-Purchasing System

Rocky Mountain

E-Purchasing System | il

Summary of Responses to IFB-4020-15-DH

All companies that match this solicitation are shown below. The responses with red company names took exceptions. Clicking on the Vendor ID will take you to that company's
response where you may see more information and also enter a comment.

Document Title: Mesa County Asphalt Crack Fill, Seal Coat & Stripe Project 2015
Deadline: 3/19/2015 prior to 3:00 PM M.D.T.
Vendor ID Company Name Received Response Documents
Included in response are product sheets | Contractors Bid Form
83319 |AM-PM Sweepers and Stripes 03/16/2015 01:02 PM from SealMaster. We received Addendum | Product Sheets
#1. Bid Sheet
86516 |Armor ProSeal 03/19/2015 11:40 AM nuvo 500 Price Bids
86516 |Armor ProSeal 03/19/2015 11:41 AM nuvo 500 bid form
29033 |asphalt specialists & supply, inc. 03/18/2015 04:35 PM We did receive addenda #1. Grand Junction / Mesa County

Bid

Cracksealer material will be of premium
quality, meet or exceed ASTM 3405
33219 |P&H Equipment 03/19/2015 09:43 AM specification. Sealcoat will be either a Pricing
coal tar or asphalt emulsion based on
buyers preference

SEALCO CONTRACTOR BID

FORM
SEALCO BID FORM
48238 | SealCo Incorporated 03/16/2015 03:08 PM DOCUMENTS ATTACHED CRACKSEAL
SPECIFICATIONS
SEALCO GUARANTEE
86490 |STRAIGHT EDGE STRIPING LLC 03/18/2015 09:35 AM Pricing
10022 |HCL Engineering & Surveying No Response

Engineering Service Company of

10065 Colorado, Inc. No Response
10066 | American Civil Constructors, Inc No Response
10077 |Golden Triangle Construction No Response
10133 |C & R Electrical Contractors No Response
10147 | Sun Construction, Inc. No Response
10216 | Sturgeon Electric Company, Inc. No Response
10223 |Allied Recycled Aggregates No Response
10231 |URS No Response
10238 APC Construction Co., LLC No Response
10250 |Aberdeen Construction, Inc. No Response
10264 | Contech Engineered Solutions LLC No Response
10342 | Grounds Service Company, Inc. No Response
10418 |Dana Kepner Co. INC. No Response
10483 | Structures, Inc. No Response
10513 |Pioneer Sand Co., Inc. No Response

https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/Admin/Award/Review_LumpSum/Review_LumpSum?20.asp?TN=126721&bi=934&Do_View=View+Responses[3/20/2015 11:16:27 AM]


https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/Admin/Award/Review_LumpSum/Review_LumpSum25.asp?VN=AM%2DPM+Sweepers+and+Stripes&VI=83319&TN=126721&BI=934&rsp=1
https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/StoredDoc/RockyMountain/documents/vendorResponse/126721_83319_1_3.PDF
https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/StoredDoc/RockyMountain/documents/vendorResponse/126721_83319_1_1.PDF
https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/StoredDoc/RockyMountain/documents/vendorResponse/126721_83319_1_2.PDF
https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/Admin/Award/Review_LumpSum/Review_LumpSum25.asp?VN=Armor+ProSeal&VI=86516&TN=126721&BI=934&rsp=2
https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/StoredDoc/RockyMountain/documents/vendorResponse/126721_86516_2_1.XLSX
https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/Admin/Award/Review_LumpSum/Review_LumpSum25.asp?VN=Armor+ProSeal&VI=86516&TN=126721&BI=934&rsp=3
https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/StoredDoc/RockyMountain/documents/vendorResponse/126721_86516_3_1.JPG
https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/Admin/Award/Review_LumpSum/Review_LumpSum25.asp?VN=asphalt+specialists+%26+supply%2C+inc%2E&VI=29033&TN=126721&BI=934&rsp=1
https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/StoredDoc/RockyMountain/documents/vendorResponse/126721_29033_1_1.XLSX
https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/StoredDoc/RockyMountain/documents/vendorResponse/126721_29033_1_1.XLSX
https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/Admin/Award/Review_LumpSum/Review_LumpSum25.asp?VN=P%26H+Equipment&VI=33219&TN=126721&BI=934&rsp=1
https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/StoredDoc/RockyMountain/documents/vendorResponse/126721_33219_1_1.XLSX
https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/Admin/Award/Review_LumpSum/Review_LumpSum25.asp?VN=SealCo+Incorporated&VI=48238&TN=126721&BI=934&rsp=1
https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/StoredDoc/RockyMountain/documents/vendorResponse/126721_48238_1_3.PDF
https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/StoredDoc/RockyMountain/documents/vendorResponse/126721_48238_1_3.PDF
https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/StoredDoc/RockyMountain/documents/vendorResponse/126721_48238_1_1.XLSX
https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/StoredDoc/RockyMountain/documents/vendorResponse/126721_48238_1_2.PDF
https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/StoredDoc/RockyMountain/documents/vendorResponse/126721_48238_1_2.PDF
https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/StoredDoc/RockyMountain/documents/vendorResponse/126721_48238_1_4.PDF
https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/Admin/Award/Review_LumpSum/Review_LumpSum25.asp?VN=STRAIGHT+EDGE+STRIPING+LLC&VI=86490&TN=126721&BI=934&rsp=1
https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/StoredDoc/RockyMountain/documents/vendorResponse/126721_86490_1_1.XLSX
https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/Admin/main.asp
https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/Admin/main.asp
https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/Admin/Logout.asp
https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/Admin/Support/Contact.asp
https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/Admin/Support/ReferAgency.asp

Rocky Mountain E-Purchasing System

10541 Metro Pavers, Inc No Response
10542 | Oxford Recycling, Inc No Response
10607 | Gilmore Construction Corporation No Response
10657 GADES SALES INC No Response
10667 |Palace Construction Co., Inc. No Response
10684 |Bosco Constructors, Inc. No Response
10689 SEMA Construction, Inc. No Response
10758 | Premier Silica No Response
10779 KECI Colorado, Inc. No Response
10952 | Ennis Paint No Response
11066 |ThorWorks Industries, Inc. No Response
11071 |New Design Construction No Response
11135 |Barba & Sons Construction, Inc. No Response
11196 | GE Johnson Construction Company No Response
11215 |Pinkard Construction Company No Response
11232 |MW GOLDEN CONSTRUCTORS No Response
11240 |JR Engineering No Response
11261 |M.A. Mortenson Company No Response
11281 |Lillard & Clark Construction Co., Inc. No Response
11337 | White Construction Group No Response
11426 |J. F. Sato & Associates No Response
11436 |GEI Consultants, Inc. No Response
11481 KB Construction, Inc. No Response
11503 Bassett & Associates, Inc. No Response
11518 |Aggregate Industries No Response
11536 |Milender White Construction Co. No Response
11551 Concrete Works of Colorado, Inc. No Response
11563 | Amec Foster Wheeler No Response
11568 | Gamma Construction Company No Response
11589 | Technology Constructors, Inc. No Response
11674 | Martin Marietta Materials No Response
11703 | Asphalt Specialties Co. Inc. No Response
11813 Cesare, Inc. No Response
11817 |Creative Hardscape No Response
11822 |Adarand Constructors No Response
11824 |Brannan Sand & Gravel Company No Response
11834 | Premier Specialty Contractors No Response
11891 | Velocity Constructors, Inc. No Response
11914 |JCOR Mechanical, Inc. No Response
11995 |Diamond Excavating, Inc No Response
12001 |[T. Lowell Construction, Inc. No Response
12020 |Horizontal Boring & Tunneling No Response
12074 |COLORADO BARRICADE CO. No Response
12077 |Humphries Poli Architects No Response
12085 |Layne Heavy Civil, Inc. No Response
12103 |Ready Mixed Concrete Co. No Response
12351 |Pate Construction Company, Inc. No Response
12372 | Ground Engineering Consultants No Response
12421 | Unique Paving Materials No Response
12483 |RMA Group No Response
12508 |Mountain States Lighting No Response

https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/Admin/Award/Review_LumpSum/Review_LumpSum?20.asp?TN=126721&bi=934&Do_View=View+Responses[3/20/2015 11:16:27 AM]




Rocky Mountain E-Purchasing System

12636 Cobitco, Inc. No Response
12654 Fischer Construction, Inc. No Response
12660 PCL Construction Services, Inc. No Response
12661 |Albert Frei and Sons No Response
12669 |FCI Constructors, Inc No Response
12733 |NCB, LLC No Response
12773 | Peak Traffic Management, LLC No Response
12792 |HDSupply Waterworks No Response
12837 |Asphalt Coatings Co., Inc. No Response
12841 |Colorado Designscapes, Inc. No Response
12977 |Expert Contract Maintenance No Response
13016 |NPW Contracting, Inc. No Response
13118 | Thoutt Bros. Concrete Contractors, Inc. No Response
13135 |ABCO Contracting, Inc. No Response
13251 |ALL ACCESS INC. No Response
13254 | American West Construction, LLC No Response
13273 T2 Construction, Inc. No Response
13317 |Brierley Associates No Response
13537 DRC Construction Services, Inc. No Response
13543 |Bear Excavating No Response
13561 | City Wide Maintenance of Colorado No Response
13640 |Keene Concrete, Inc. No Response
13726 | Short Elliott Hendrickson Inc. No Response
13756 |ROADWAY SAFETY SOLUTIONS, LLC No Response
13768 Inlet Structures , Inc. No Response
13775 | Split Rail Fence Company No Response
13821 |Tezak Heavy Equipment Co., Inc. No Response
13898 |DeAndrea Coring & Sawing, Inc No Response
13960 |SiteWise Corporation No Response
14216 |Hall-lrwin Corporation No Response
14317 |Taylor Kohrs LLC No Response
14331 | Turner Construction Company No Response
14343 Parkerson Construction, Inc. No Response
14381 | Scott Contracting, Inc. No Response
14422 | Facility Solutions Group No Response
14530 |EC Electric, Inc. No Response
14580 |Mountain Valley Contracting, Inc No Response
14581 | Premier Paving Inc. No Response
14593 |LVW Electronics No Response
14615 |Colorado West Contracting, Inc No Response
14718 |Ford Construction Company, Inc. No Response
15025 Gould Construction, Inc No Response
15038 |M M Skyline Contracting, Inc. No Response
15153 | Growling Bear Co. (Inc.) No Response
15173 |Hudspeth and Associates, Inc. No Response
15232 | Ludwig Drilling No Response
15245 | Elam Construction, Inc. No Response
15360 |High Country Engineering, Inc. No Response
15381 |L.O.S.T. CONSTRUCTION, INC No Response
15515 |Coatings, Inc. No Response
15609 |RN Civil Construction No Response
15619 BCAC?SQAR,I\‘(I:E’SWC' dba ASAP No Response

https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/Admin/Award/Review_LumpSum/Review_LumpSum?20.asp?TN=126721&bi=934&Do_View=View+Responses[3/20/2015 11:16:27 AM]




Rocky Mountain E-Purchasing System

15660 | Traffic Control West, Inc. No Response
15671 |Archer Western Construction No Response
15680 |Renner Sports Surfaces No Response
15718 l—'i/(le;l:a\:\éa;;rsn(fillztructlon and No Response
15721 |Environmental Logistics No Response
15751 |CHATO'S CONCRETE, LLC No Response
15799 | Alpine Roofing Co., Inc. No Response
15855 |R.E. Monks Construction Co.LLC No Response
15926 |Deery / CRAFCO INC. No Response
15952 |Cintas Fire Protection, A Cintas Company No Response
15990 |Ames Construction Inc No Response
15992 |Kelley Trucking Inc. No Response
15993 |HTM Construction Company No Response
15994 | K. R. Swerdfeger Construction, Inc. No Response
16199 |Iron Woman Construction No Response
16216 |Lawson Construction Company No Response
16340 |Denver Industrial Sales & Service Co. Inc. No Response
16357 |Left Hand Excavating No Response
16375 Double E, Inc. dba Electrical Excellence No Response
16377 C & L Water Solutions, Inc. No Response
16391 |Rock and Co. No Response
16455 | GMCO Corporation No Response
16458 | Hudick Excavating, Inc. No Response
16549 |Noraa Concrete Construction Corporation No Response
16573 |Allstates Coatings Co. No Response
16685 Richdell Construction, Inc. No Response
16749 |Legacy Mechanical Inc. No Response
16824 Larkin And Associates, LLC No Response
16912 |JPL Cares No Response
16948 | Alpha Milling Co No Response
16955 |Kleinfelder No Response
17018 | Schauer Construction Company, Inc. No Response
17090 |Greiner Electric No Response
17145 | Construction Concepts, Inc. No Response
17173 Kraemer North America, LLC No Response
17188 |GoodLand Construction Inc No Response
17268 |Vance Brothers Inc No Response
17282 |J & S Contractors Supply No Response
17400 |PLM Aslphalt & Concrete Inc No Response
17496 |CTMInc No Response
17522 | Mark Young Construction, Inc. No Response
17597 |EJ No Response
17599 Maxwell Products, Inc. No Response
17671 Fasick Concrete, Inc. No Response
17792 |PENHALL COMPANY No Response
17833 | JBlanco Enterprises Inc. No Response
17857 |UNITED MATERIALS; LLC No Response
17878 | ACA Products Inc. No Response
17900 |SealMaster No Response
17919 |Ace Pipe Cleaning Inc. No Response
17950 |Yenter Companies, Inc. No Response

https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/Admin/Award/Review_LumpSum/Review_LumpSum?20.asp?TN=126721&bi=934&Do_View=View+Responses[3/20/2015 11:16:27 AM]




Rocky Mountain E-Purchasing System

18001 |Arrow J Landscape & Design, Inc. No Response
18022 |Kolbe Striping, Inc. No Response
18082 |Northern Colorado Constructors, Inc. No Response
18221 |Whitestone Construction Services, Inc. No Response
18243 | Lightning Ventures Inc. No Response
18292 |LT Environmental, Inc No Response
18296 |Plaza Construction Inc. No Response
18347 |Cam Services No Response
18349 Hancock Ventures, Inc. No Response
18701 |GROTH CONSTRUCTION No Response
18725 |Western Slope Materials No Response
18791 |Con-Sy, Inc. No Response
18796 |C & J Gravel Products, Inc. No Response
18830 |Canyon Construction Company No Response
18949 Universal Industrial Sales, Inc. No Response
18972 | American Fabricators No Response
19093 |Waterford Corporation No Response
19131 | Newstrom-Davis Construction Company No Response
19216 | Willis of Colorado, Inc. No Response
19244 | Concrete Express, Inc No Response
19252 | Schlessman Concrete, Inc. No Response
19306 |Bonds Construction, L.L.C. No Response
19308 AzTec Consultants, Inc. No Response

Oldcastle SW Group dba Four Corners

19310 Materials No Response
19371 |Keyway Curb Company No Response
19419 |Jaynes Corporation No Response
19436 |Azteca Landscape Inc. No Response
19469 Lil' Dirt Wc?rks LLC dba Water's Edge No Response
Reclamation
19571 |Brown Brothers Asphalt & Concrete Inc. No Response
19649 |Lindsay Precast, Inc. No Response
19659 |Bechtolt Engineering No Response
19694 |NWCC INC. No Response
19920 |Ed Green Construction Co No Response
19938 L.G. Everist, Inc No Response
19965 | Global Underground Corporation No Response
20002 |Weld County Construction Company Inc. No Response
20070 |Precision Excavating, Inc. No Response
20088 |Industrial Constructors/Managers, Inc. No Response
20151 [J&T Consulting, Inc No Response
20168 |Mays Construction Specialties, Inc. No Response
20210 |Pipeline Strategies and Integrity, LLC No Response
20308 |Branson Traffic Control Co Inc No Response
20334 |L & M Enterprises, Inc. No Response
20365 |SCS.inc No Response
20404 |RMS Utilities No Response
20535 |Wells & West General Contractors, Inc. No Response
20552 |Landscapes Unlimited No Response
20591 |RoadSafe Traffic Systems, Inc. No Response
20592 |GMCO LLC No Response
20612 |Heyl Construction Inc. No Response
20680 Summit Sealants, Inc. No Response

https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/Admin/Award/Review_LumpSum/Review_LumpSum?20.asp?TN=126721&bi=934&Do_View=View+Responses[3/20/2015 11:16:27 AM]
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20735 |Ward Construction, LLC No Response
20766 |J2 Contracting Co. No Response
20768 |Frontier Paving Inc No Response
20773 |Interwest Safety Supply Inc No Response
20790 | Coulson Excavating Company, Inc No Response
20805 ZAK DIRT,INC. No Response
20831 |APComPower Inc. No Response
20880 |Maxwell Asphalt, Inc. No Response
20904 GLH Construction, Inc. No Response
20943 |Lawrence Construction Company No Response
20944 |Hess Contracting, Inc. No Response
21018 |Grand River Construction No Response
21078 |Connell Resources, Inc. No Response
21121 |King Surveyors, Inc. No Response
21134 |Kuersten Construction LLC No Response
21138 | Total Concrete Services, Inc. No Response
21164 |Communications Products and Service No Response
21200 Kirkland Construction, LLLP No Response
21216 |Durango Electrical Services, Inc. No Response
21230 |Nixcavating, Inc. No Response
21252 VILLALOBOS CONCRETE INC No Response
21258 |Nilex USA, Inc No Response
21317 |Northstar Concrete No Response
21334 Russ T. Diamonds, Inc. No Response
21377 |G.L. Hoff Company dba Hoff Construction No Response
21435 |Carnes Services LLC No Response
21443 |Blue Ridge Construction, Inc. No Response
21477 |Johnson Construction, Inc. No Response
21659 |Mountain Constructors, Inc. No Response
21680 |Intermountain Slurry Seal No Response
21767 Daktronics, Inc. No Response
21796 |Northern Engineering Services, Inc. No Response
21829 |Ditesco No Response
21869 Robinson & Co., Inc. No Response
21966 |Gracon Corporation No Response
22065 | Four Corners Pre Cast, Inc. No Response
22180 |Brierley Associates No Response
22253 | Gerrard Excavating, Inc. No Response
22301 |H.W. Houston Construction Co. No Response
22386 |Inter-Mountain Construction Equipment No Response
22408 |Edge Contracting No Response
22445 | AA CONSTRUCTION CO., INC. No Response
22710 Moltz Construction, Inc. No Response
22744 | Spallone Construction, Inc. No Response
22781 |Castle Rock Construction Company No Response
22894 |Basalite Concrete Products No Response
22933 |Lightfield Enterprises Inc. No Response
23106 |Terra Automated Systems No Response
23280 |Wylaco Supply Co No Response
23302 Colorado Materials, Inc. No Response
23473 |E-Z Excavating, Inc. No Response
23506 |Eckstine Electric Co No Response

https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/Admin/Award/Review_LumpSum/Review_LumpSum?20.asp?TN=126721&bi=934&Do_View=View+Responses[3/20/2015 11:16:27 AM]
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23553 Don Kehn Construction, Inc. No Response
23563 |Mollenhauer Group No Response
23589 |Luchetti Surveying Inc. No Response
23610 |International Cybernetics Corporation No Response
23640 |Q3 Contracting Inc. No Response
23679 |MPB Contractors, Inc. No Response
23683 |Insituform Technologies, Inc. No Response
23733 | TMT Cutters Inc. No Response
23810 |Mel-Ro Construction Inc. No Response
24133 |Barton Supply No Response
24144 | Metco Landscape, Inc. No Response
24170 |DeFalco Construction Company No Response
24201 | Sun Construction & Facility Services, Inc. No Response
24236 |Rhinotrax Construction No Response
24246 |Bryan Construction, Inc. No Response
24419 |Jalisco International, Inc. No Response
24455 | COCAT Restoration & Reconstruction LLC No Response
24505 | Custom Environmental Design No Response
24522 TLM Constructors, Inc. No Response
24596 |Concrete Construction Specialties No Response
24663 |Can-Do Concrete Construction Inc. No Response
24810 AGGREGATE INDUSTRIES No Response
24878 |Kiewit Infrastructure Co. No Response
25232 |A-1 Barricade & Sign, Inc. No Response
25297 |Varra Companies, Inc. No Response
25661 |Prairie Snow Enterprises, Inc. No Response
25718 | NCI Norkoli Construction Inc. No Response
25895 | McCauley Constructors Inc. No Response
25945 | Aztec General Contractors, LLC No Response
25962 | CH2M Hill - Transportation Group No Response
25965 |Mueller Construction Services No Response
26137 |Inquip Associates Inc No Response
26392 Nunn Construction, Inc. No Response
26418 |Bassett Construction Company No Response
26467 |Gonzales Construction Company, Inc. No Response
26588 |Advanced Concrete Solutions, Inc No Response
26620 |Front Range Finishes, LLC No Response
26678 |Dunrite Excavation Inc. No Response
26763 |Loris and Associates No Response
26888 NetStructures, Inc No Response
27037 |Avalanche Air Conditioning & Heating Inc No Response
27086 |Affordable Rooter and More LLC No Response
27288 |PG Construction Services Inc. No Response
27391 |Kempton Construction LLC No Response
27460 |CDI No Response
27556 |Martin Marietta Materials, Inc. No Response
27611 |Blue Mountain Seeding Inc. No Response
27616 |Proline West LLC No Response
27662 Bohannan Huston, Inc. No Response
27743 |Precise Striping LLC No Response
27987 |Van's Equipment Company No Response
28217 |Alpha and Omega Consultants, Inc No Response

https://www.rockymountainbidsystem.com/Admin/Award/Review_LumpSum/Review_LumpSum?20.asp?TN=126721&bi=934&Do_View=View+Responses[3/20/2015 11:16:27 AM]




Rocky Mountain E-Purchasing System

28505 | AISA Civil, Inc No Response
28699 | Chiddix Bros. Inc. No Response
28790 |Elk Creek Sand & Gravel LLC No Response
28821 |Crossfire, LLC No Response
28863 | Skyline Steel No Response
28916 |CRG Construction Inc. No Response
28944 | TRS Incorporated No Response
28984 | Altus Traffic Management No Response
29051 |Schmidt Construction Company No Response
29231 | Triston Construction, Inc No Response
29266 |Rocky Mountain Excavating, Inc. No Response
29343 | Even-Preisser, Inc. No Response
29718 |Desert Mountain Corporation No Response
29804 |ZoZo Group, lic No Response
29973 |Smalley & Company No Response
30145 |Intermountain Traffic LLC No Response
30313 |MOUNTAIN ALARM No Response
30926 |St Andrews Construciton Services No Response
31318 |all pro seaing and asphalt No Response
31520 |Art C. Klein Construction, Inc. No Response
31615 |Corr Enterprises, LLC No Response
31710 |Glaser Electric Company, LLC No Response
31764 |Rider Levett Bucknall Ltd. No Response
31829 |ACC Roofing Inc. No Response
31907 Summers Construction, LLC No Response
31920 |Hunt Construction No Response
31988 |Weeminuche Construction Authority No Response
32019 |Aggregate Industries No Response
32072 | Chacon Paving Inc No Response
32140 |Calibre Engineering, Inc No Response
32154 |New West Paving No Response
32200 |McCollum's Excavating No Response
32401 |Capitol Communications, Inc. No Response
32414 |Bradley Excavating Inc. No Response
32426 |Professional Restoration & Repair No Response
32492 |Irwin Industries No Response
32699 |Western Construction & Design, Inc. No Response
32768 |Western Industrial Contractors No Response
32787 |PAA Contractors Inc. No Response
33047 Hank Williams Inc. dba Williams No Response
Construction
33080 Garza Concrete Structures, Inc No Response
33138 Recco, Inc. dba Five-R Co. No Response
33242 FRC&B, Inc. No Response
33422 |Mountain Range Concrete Inc No Response
33655 |Everist Materials,LLC No Response
33680 |Harris Homes Inc dba Harris Constructors No Response
33729 |Colorado Asphalt Services, Inc. No Response
33793 |Franklin Drilling & Blasting, Inc. No Response
33857 Sk_angka USA Civil West Rocky Mountain No Response
District Inc
33920 Hamon Contractors, Inc. No Response
34061 |Sky to Ground LLC No Response
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34129 |son-haul Inc No Response
34184 |Rodriguez Construction Org., L.L.C. No Response
34498 |Flatiron Constructors, Inc. No Response
34643 |Colorado Pump Service & Supply co No Response
34650 |Tab Construction, Inc No Response
34802 | A&S Construction Co. No Response
34813 |Kemp and Hoffman, Inc. No Response
34859 | Alvarado Construction, Inc. No Response
35089 |Zachry Engineering Corporation No Response
35146 |Empire Management No Response
35169 |Trautner Geotech No Response
35429 |Security 1st Welding No Response
35558 |Fiore and Sons, Inc. No Response
35712 |Platt Rogers Construction No Response
35722 |Roberts Excavation Corporation No Response
35734 |AC Excavating, Inc No Response
35819 Ideal Concrete, Inc. No Response
35838 |Hydro Construction Company, Inc. No Response
35938 |Schanel Construction, Inc No Response
36099 |EZ Street No Response
36227 |JC Excavating, Inc. No Response
36456 |Redline Pipeline No Response
36515 Mountain Barricade, Inc No Response
36663 | Terra Constructors Inc. No Response
36733 |Twisted Timber No Response
37112 |The Perfect Patch Asphalt Company Inc No Response
37157 Dave & Lana Waters, Inc. No Response
37192 |Infinity Solutions Inc. No Response
37355 |cmc rebar No Response
37407 M.E. GROUP No Response
37424 STRAIGHT LINE SAWCUTTING No Response
37603 |Animas Valley Construction LLC No Response
37676 |DESIGNER COLUMNS andPIERS L.L.C No Response
37863 |Howell Construction No Response
37865 Silva Construction, Inc. No Response
37957 |Bonneville Asphalt & Repair LLC No Response
37991 |Colorado Asphalt Works, Inc. No Response
38115 | Hilti No Response
38220 EGS, Inc. No Response
38388 UCAL,Inc. No Response
38432 |Foothills Paving & Maintenance, Inc. No Response
38873 | Gilbert Contracting, Inc. No Response
39115 |Earth Green Fence No Response
39123 F;OS(FZ’E\;\EOUNTAIN MATERIALS AND No Response
39125 |DS Constructors LLC No Response
39172 |Grandview Landscape-Irrigation Corp No Response
39189 |Front Range Environmental LLC No Response
39207 |Larimer Construction No Response
39245 |energy solutions, inc. No Response
39257 FGO;I;ttll_eLgernandez Transportation No Response
39271 |CDH Trucking & Excavating No Response
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39382 |Keeping Pace, Inc. No Response
39418 |Cap Excavating & Demolition, Inc. No Response
39554 |Purgatoire Valley Construction, Inc. No Response
39558 |Custom Services of Colorado, Inc No Response
39565 |NRE Excavating Inc No Response
39601 Underground Infrastructure Technologies No Response
LLC.
39607 |JBC Ent. Inc No Response
40075 |McAsphalt Industries Limited No Response
40106 |ROCS Traffic Control No Response
40167 Solid Rock Excavation,LLC No Response
40222 |Bloom Floralscapes, LLC No Response
40462 | Church Surveying, LLC No Response
40849 |Loya Construction, Inc. No Response
41076 |Tensar International Corp. No Response
41144 |CMS, Inc No Response
41151 | United Companies No Response
41629 | Copestone General Contractors No Response
41729 | Daniel-Barry Construction, Inc. No Response
41840 Rummel Construction, Inc. No Response
41841 |Caberra Systems Inc. No Response
41986 | Patrick Engineering No Response
42003 [ESCO Construction Company No Response
42103 CDS ENGINEERING CORP No Response
42218 |Anson Excavating & Pipe Inc. No Response
42259 | King Systems, LLC No Response
42528 [SUNCOR ENERGY (U.S.A.) INC. No Response
42597 | Tasmarr Excavating Co., Inc. No Response
42660 |Sigg-Staver Construction, LLC No Response
12724 Dirty Deeds Seeding The Erosion Control No Response
Company
42803 [DOUBLE R EXCAVATING, INC. No Response
42832 | Krule Construction LLC No Response
42902 |Habitat Construction LLC No Response
42997 | Aggregate Logistics, LLC No Response
43253 | Shelby and Son Construction,lic. No Response
43434 | McStone Aggregates No Response
43508 Redi Services, LLC. No Response
43526 Colarelli Construction, Inc. No Response
43876 | Trax Construction Inc No Response
43982 | Hydrodig Denver LLC No Response
44226 | All Demolition Excavating Company No Response
44437 |C & S Sweeping Services, Inc. No Response
44585 Rice & Rice, Inc. No Response
44592 | H and H Excavation No Response
44865 | Coyote Ridge Construction, LLC No Response
45071 | White Cap Constuction Supply No Response
45169 | Orion Environmental Inc. No Response
45214 | Avery Asphalt, Inc. No Response
45283 | Pavement Maintenance Services No Response
45414 | ADI Services No Response
45477 | Badger Daylighting No Response
45541 | Coating Specialist LLC No Response
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45545 | Calahan Construction Services Inc No Response
45719 | Wember Inc. No Response
45801 |Terracare Associates No Response
45904 | American POrtable Buildings No Response
45971 | Wabhl Civil Constructors, Inc. No Response
46454 | Robinson Construction co lic No Response
46724 |MASTEC NORTH AMERICA, INC No Response
46725 | Aspen Digger, Inc. No Response
46750 | Northwest Underwater Construction No Response
46754 |KPMC No Response
46808 F;;imier Earthworks and Infrastructure, No Response
46850 | QualCorr Engineering No Response
47063 | Desman Associates No Response
47716 |Longs Peak Landscape No Response
47762 | Transit Mix Concrete Co. No Response
47799 | Belair Site Work Services No Response
47884 |TRC CONSTRUCTION No Response
48004 |Concrete Experts, LLC No Response
48154 | Sundt Construction No Response
48157 | Custom Concrete Cutting Inc. No Response
48162 |Concrete Equipment & Supply No Response
48292 | Northern Barricade NBC No Response
48351 | Hydro-Turf Inc. No Response
48444 IES Commercial, Inc. No Response
48489 |M & S Trucking LLC No Response
48718 |Heggem-Lundquist Paint Company No Response
48773 GCS, LLC No Response
48834 |J.P.Jaquez Concrete, LLC No Response
48835 | Concrete Sidewalk Solutions, Inc No Response
48936 | Colorado Lime Company No Response
49043 | Ewing Trucking & Construction, LLC No Response
49063 | Endurance Solar & Engineering No Response

Ridgeline Construction dba Performance

49235 Recreation No Response
49348 | Colorado Commercial Roofing Inc. No Response
49608 |CFW Solutions No Response
49690 [DAN'S CUSTOM CONSTRUCTION INC. No Response
49967 | Colorado Concrete Construction LLC No Response
50381 Community Preservation & Management, No Response
LLC
51005 |BVB General Contractors No Response
51021 |IECRM No Response
51044 | Whitaker Construction Co. No Response
51392 |Crossfire, LLC No Response
51777 |Kennebec Construction Inc. No Response
52190 |Brinkmann Constructors No Response
52223 |South-side Lawn & Landscape No Response
52231 |Barnsco Inc. No Response
52270 |JL Melton Construction No Response
52597 |Tony J Beltramo & Sons, Inc. No Response
52803 |Colorado Infrastructure No Response
53045 |Cosyleon & Cosyleon, Inc. No Response
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53115 |Erie Metal Specialties, Inc. No Response
53284 |Bryan Construction No Response
53362 |Acorn Construction Company No Response
53373 |GENOVA CONSTRUCTION, INC. No Response
53422 | Montano Concrete Corp. No Response
53751 |Colorado Contracting No Response
53796 |Cold Mix Mfg Corp No Response
53984 |WORK ZONE TRAFFIC CONTROL INC. No Response
53991 |ETG Systems, INC. No Response
54245 |Bertsch Brothers/Porta Industries.Inc No Response
54251 |Altitude Training No Response
54440 |Boyd Excavating Inc. No Response
54563 | Pipeline, Inc. No Response
54762 |L&N Contractors, Inc. No Response
54930 Circuit Media, LLC No Response
55187 |ProCrete Services No Response
55209 |Cornerstone Construction Concepts, Inc. No Response
55416 814 Solutions - Seeding and Erosion No Response
Control
55504 |Avalanche Excavating, Inc No Response
55631 |J.A.D Builders No Response
55698 | The Murphy Company No Response
55849 | Accent Landscape Contractors, Inc. No Response
55945 | Southwest Liner Systems, Inc. No Response
56066 |Corsentino Construction Inc No Response
56214 |Mike Coleman construction in No Response
56220 ACHEN-GARDNER CONSTRUCTION, No Response
LLC
56307 |Durba Construction No Response
56443 Merrill, Inc. No Response
56500 |OFTEDAL CONSTRUCTION, INC. No Response
56530 Interstate Sealant & Concrete, Inc. No Response
56554 |Lobos Structures No Response
56782 | SNC Janitorial No Response
57176 TURNER ROOFING, LLC No Response
57300 |GBT Farms LLC No Response
57444 |Pagel Contracting, Inc. No Response
57468 |Flashfill Services No Response
57545 |Josephine Construction LLC No Response
57728 |Adams & Smith, Inc. No Response
57794 |barker construction No Response
57890 |Standard Concrete Inc. No Response
57914 |ADS No Response
58003 |Western Maintenance and Construction No Response
58085 |Aiken-Ford Lumber Co. No Response
58220 |LM Kersting Construction No Response
58643 |Vine Laboratories No Response
58963 |Economy Asphalt and Concrete Services No Response
58973 |Chavez Construction,Inc. No Response
59052 |All Phase Restoration, LLC No Response
59278 |Tetra Tech Construction, Inc. No Response
59462 | Symmetry Builders Inc. No Response
59550 |Arnold's Ag Group, LLC No Response
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59915 |CASI No Response
59958 |Metro Contracting Services, Inc. No Response
60099 |Sunbelt Rentals No Response
60180 |Casey's Construction, LLC No Response
60181 | Drill Tech Drilling & Shoring, Inc. No Response
60484 | Oasis Stage Werks No Response
60746 |Carwile Construction Company Inc. No Response
60751 |Rangers Concrete Inc. No Response
61537 |Kuhn Construction Inc. No Response
61551 |A to Z Cable Construction No Response
61616 |Sorensen Companies, Inc No Response
61860 |Land Ethics of Colorado No Response
61865 |Dobler Construction, Inc., No Response
61935 |Penhall Company No Response
62001 |Cathodic Protection Management, Inc. No Response
62112 |Bridge Preservation No Response
62169 |The Quikrete Companies No Response
62293 | Skyview Building & Remodeling,LLC No Response
62330 |JAND V STRIPING No Response
62743 | Claystone Construction lic No Response
62949 RIGHT POINTE COMPANY No Response
63009 |Comprehensive Risk Services, LLC No Response
63168 |Western Milling LLC No Response
63363 |APEX Pavement Solutions No Response
63364 |Upland Companies Inc No Response

Iron Mountain Demolition& Roll-Off;

63597 Former Baldwin No Response
63891 |Milo Construction Corporation No Response
63950 |[H2X LLC No Response
64122 |DGO Access lic No Response
64261 | Summit Sweeping & Asphalt Maintenance No Response
64471 | ColorScape of Colorado No Response
64649 | MJ Hughes Construction, Inc. No Response
64687 | Christopher Hurt Software No Response
64751 Columbine Hills Concrete, Inc. No Response
64980 |Concrete Contractors Interstate No Response
65047 |H&A Concrete Sawing Inc. No Response
65061 |Jenco Contracting, LLC No Response
65132 | Armor Paving No Response
65232 | Duckels Construction, Inc. No Response
65422 |Native Excavating No Response
65442 |DRX Enterprises, LLC No Response
65511 |Western Colorado Contractors Association No Response
66061 |MLM Construction No Response
66161 |Asphalt Roadways & Parking Lots, Inc. No Response
66300 |Iron Mike Construction No Response
66506 |D & D Security LLC No Response
66520 |Tamerrel Excavation, Inc No Response
66692 |Rocky Mountain Hydroseeding, LLC No Response
66753 |Dondlinger Construction Co. No Response
66977 BAHA Construction, Inc. No Response
67038 |Eclipse Surveying, Inc. No Response
67065 |Hamilton Construction Co. No Response
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67530 IPR, Ltd No Response
67537 |Skanska No Response
67916 |Precision Landworks LLC No Response
67986 |Builders News No Response
68074 | Advanced Tower Services, Inc No Response
68386 |Hammerlund Construction, LLC No Response
68459 |Jacks of all trades iinc. No Response
68510 |Cherry Creek Recycling No Response
68570 Cantgrbury Construction Management No Response
Services, Inc
68762 |CP&Y Inc. No Response
69261 |Savage Excavation LCC No Response
69350 Pavement Restoration, Inc. No Response
69389 |Anglin Civil No Response
69403 |Al Garage Door Services, inc. No Response
69509 | Staker Parson dba Burdick Materials No Response
69510 |COLORADO CRUSHING INC No Response
69516 | Wildcat Construction Co., Inc. No Response
69554 M S Excavation No Response
69555 |Kc Construction Restoration No Response
69587 |Jim No Response
69620 |J D Fields &Company Inc. No Response
69663 |U.S. Eagle Security LLC No Response
69816 |Byrd Enterprises, LLC No Response
70154 |Saguaro GeoServices, Inc. No Response
70208 |Hawkeye Striping Inc. No Response
70221 |Tusca Construction Incorporated No Response
70279 |Argus Contracting, LP No Response
70316 |Arctic Cooling and Heating No Response
70438 |EZ Play Surfaces LLC No Response
70707 |Ullerick Enterprises No Response
70775 | Grand Junction Lawns & Landscape No Response
70840 | Wild, Wild West Development, Inc. No Response
70911 | The Groundcrew, Inc. No Response
71332 |Mangum Civil Constructors, Inc No Response
71468 | TD Production, Inc. No Response
71721 |Metro Contracting Services, Inc. No Response
71743 |Mountainland Supply Co. No Response
71758 | Alford Company No Response
71779 ihgl\'\l/ll\s:"\lrsRlAL AND SUPPLY No Response
71868 |Giles Construction LLC No Response
71918 |CNC Technical Services No Response
72212 |Diversified Concrete Cutting, Inc. No Response
72691 |Lobato Construction No Response
72925 |Moody Construction and Sons inc. No Response
72998 Concrete Floor Service, Inc. No Response
73090 |North Fork Native Plants No Response
73116 |D&M Utiltiy Services No Response
73364 | Aztec Engineering Group Inc No Response
73462 |Loveland Barricade,LLC No Response
73811 |Peace Makers Security Integrators LLC No Response
73825 Kissner G.C., Inc. No Response
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73937 | NeZhoni Construction No Response
74000 |Alpha Corporation No Response
74139 |Graham County Land Company, LLC No Response
74141 Richardson Consolidated, Inc. No Response
74157 | TCB Construction Company, Inc. No Response
74330 |Candelaria Construction Inc. No Response
74358 |Riverwise Engineering, LLC No Response
74454 | hamon contractors inc. No Response
74458 | American Geoservices, LLC No Response
74503 | Atkinson Construction No Response
74569 |Five Star Companies, LLC No Response
74727 |Halcyon Construction, Inc. No Response
74811 |livingLAB No Response
74851 | AGPROfessionals No Response
75016 |Deep South Sand & Gravel Enter, LLC No Response
75074 | Heeter Construction Inc. No Response
75076 |Coloscapes Concrete, Inc. No Response
75123 | Trinity ESC-Boulder No Response
75336 | T.L. Wallace Construction, Inc. No Response
75436 |NW Construction Inc. No Response
75533 Remmereid Construction, LLC No Response
75576 |Caddis LLC No Response
75619 | Xtreme Pressure Washing LLC No Response
75707 | EcoOne Inc. No Response
75749 | Mobilease Modular Space No Response
75862 | All Pro Services No Response
75926 | McCullough Construction Inc No Response
76033 | Guth Construction No Response
26041 TMC SHOOTING RANGE SPECIALIST No Response
INC.
76307 |NASCO No Response
76436 |l E Consulting No Response
76447 |Penhall Company No Response
76520 |Redpoint Contracting No Response
76553 |Kauffman Seal Coating No Response
76634 | A-1 Traffic Control & Barricade, Inc. No Response
76665 | Fall Line Testing & Inspection, LLC No Response
76688 |Beyond Restoration Construction Inc. No Response
76761 |EMR Enterprises, LLC No Response
76768 |Colt & Steel Corporation No Response
76869 |Urban Investment Group No Response
76924 | Tyke Pierce Construction No Response
77017 |Canyon Landscape and Design, LLC No Response
77160 |Beaver Construction Consulting, Inc. No Response
77178 |Fedco, Inc No Response
77288 |Dillon Construction No Response
77340 |Powers Construction No Response
77354 | Mile High Paving, Co. No Response
77498 |Laser Oilfield services LTD No Response
77557 |Adam Il Inc No Response
78190 ROCKY MOUNTAIN DEVELOPMENT No Response
LLC
78224 | Colorado Asphalt Services Inc. No Response
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78385 | White Sands Water LLC. No Response
78431 |Roaring Fork hardscapes No Response
78489 |Innovative Marking Systems No Response
78500 |Rick Engineering Company No Response
78501 |Hartz Info Tech, Inc. No Response
78568 | Encol Construction No Response
78577 |Ashley Concrete Structures, LLC. No Response
78618 | TK Mining Services No Response
78626 |Gee Asphalt Systems, Inc. No Response
78734 |Prospect Electric No Response
78765 |bailey tree lic No Response
78834 |Meyers Excavation Services No Response
78894 AZ ASPHALT No Response
78896 |Camo Construction LLC No Response
79001 (B &Y Drilling Inc. No Response
79149 JEI Contractors, Inc No Response
79187 |bower bros const No Response
79192 MNC, LLC No Response
79264 |G Construction Co., LLC No Response
79265 |Industrial Contractors Inc. No Response
79317 DJK INNOVATIONS (Itd) No Response
79334  |Urban Integrations LLC No Response
79528 | Teltech Communications, LLC No Response
79566 | TSJ Trucking & Excavating No Response
79758 |Osmun Inc. No Response
79787 | Avalanche Waterslides, Inc. No Response
79798 K&E Construction, Inc. No Response
79880 |Cutler Repaving, Inc No Response
79999 |Marine Diving Solutions No Response
80114 |Patrick Construction No Response
80386 |[CH2M HILL No Response
80436 |Access Limited Construction No Response
80522 |Gorman & Company, Inc No Response
80544 |[LSI No Response
80660 |5280 Civil Construction LLC No Response
80675 |SunShine Supply Company No Response
80921 |Rocky Mountain Access Controls, Inc No Response
80936 |Tusca 2, Inc. No Response
81053 |B&G Constrution LLC No Response
81054 |Brand Energy Services No Response
81199 Builders Custom Counter, Inc No Response
81204 |BluLNG No Response
81312 |EnviroFinance Group, LLC No Response
81500 |Pro Patria Construction LLC No Response
81530 |Epic Construction & Environmental Inc. No Response
81579 K2 Construction No Response
81583 |Sapper Construction No Response
81712 |Valles Construction LLC No Response
81759 |Valentino Construction, LLC No Response
81897 |Conroy Excavating Inc. No Response
82049 |Concreations Inc. No Response
82100 |Bressem Inc No Response
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82226 |Patriot Sealcoating No Response
82273 |Morrow & Sons Construction No Response
82309 |Williams Construction No Response
82321 Urban Design &amp;amp; Construction No Response
Ltd
82417 |DKB,Inc. No Response
82437 | Two in the Loop Inc No Response
82455 | Araco Concrete Contractor No Response
82534 |llaka Solutions LLC No Response
82622 |Marsh Creek LLC No Response
82775 |DCP Civil LLC. No Response
82807 |Heath Construction LLC No Response
82839 |Hammer Head Mgt, Inc No Response
82848 |Monumental building services, LLC. No Response
82878 | mountain states snowcats No Response
83078 |J & R Construction LLC No Response
83085 |MAverick Pump Services No Response
83157 |Morissette Construction Services No Response
83223 Seal Coat Solutions, Inc. No Response
83273 Ames Construction, Inc. No Response
83335 |Core One Dirilling, Inc. No Response
83519 Belle and Bleu LLC dba Bin There Dump No Response
That
83550 |Dietzler Construction Corporation No Response
83571 |Guaranteed Home & Building Restoration No Response
83574 S'\;lzr:al\g:;eéifment Consulting & Project No Response
83641 |Tukmol General Contractor No Response
83770 |RGI Construction, LLC No Response
83799 |All Around Roustabout No Response
83841 |advantage chemical corp No Response
83967 |Acord asphalt No Response
84011 |Dan Friel Construction No Response
84040 |jway southern No Response
84096 |Evergreen Industrial, Ltd. No Response
84129 |Dwire Earthmoving, LLC No Response
84149 | Alcon Construction Inc No Response
84174 |Silvercloud Construction Group LLC No Response
84226 |IJMG CONCRETE SERVICES LLC No Response
84251 |StrongGo Industries, Llc. No Response
84282 | Minger Construction Companies, Inc. No Response
84334 |EcolLife No Response
84338 |Ridgeline Excavating No Response
84367 |ATH Specialties & Sales Inc. No Response
84408 |k&amp;s enterprises, inc. No Response
84481 |Regan Construction, Inc. No Response
84540 |J & L Pipeline Contractors, Inc No Response
84551 |Thunder Road Asphalt, LLC No Response
84557 Unbridled Contractors, LLC No Response
84558 Harrison Qilfield Services, Inc. No Response
84617 |TY-REX Construction No Response
84625 |Chet Schlegel No Response
o mespnse
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84827 |Melvin Geib Inc No Response
84875 |Berno Construction No Response
84877 |ProTech Coatings Inc. No Response
85026 |Bristlecone Landscapes LLC No Response
85165 |Paragon Roofing Inc. No Response
85265 |[ICONINC No Response
85348 |Concrete Concrete, Inc. No Response
85435 |Affordable Concrete LLC No Response
85475 |Advanced Road Tech No Response
85587 | Tuscany Homes No Response
85636 |Spartan Steel and Iron Works No Response
85693 |Wise Services, Inc. No Response
85873 | American Environmental Aviation, Inc No Response
85881 |Peterson Excavating Inc No Response
85882 | Shon Amundsen Construction LLC. No Response
85983 |Bristlecone Construction Corporation No Response
86019 |[12085LLC No Response
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STRAIGHTEDGE STRIPING

Acknowledged Addenda 1 | Contractor's Bid Form Attendance Lot Name Crack Fill Seal Coat Striping Patch Work

NO NO YES Central Services No Bid No Bid $825.00 AN
Sheriff Office Total: No Bid No Bid $1,073.00 AN
Justice Center Total: No Bid No Bid $2,750.00 &\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\x
Criminal Justice Center Total: No Bid No Bid $510.00 |No Bid I
Courthouse Lot No Bid No Bid $220.00 AAAAAAAANN
GVT Downtown Transfer Station |No Bid No Bid $150.00 &\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\N
GVT Clifton Transfer Station No Bid No Bid $250.00 AN
Long Family Memorial Park Total: |No Bid No Bid $2,435.00 &\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\N
Clifton Community Center No Bid No Bid $200.00 &\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\
Fairgrounds Total: No Bid No Bid $5,775.00 |No Bid |
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