



BID RECAP

SOLICITATION TITLE:	Om Fire Station Furnishings
SOLICITATION NUMBER:	IFB-4122-15-NJ
OPENING DATE:	11/6/2015
OPENING TIME:	2:00pm
PROJECT MANAGER:	Casey Sievila / Lee Cooper
BUYER NAME:	Nick Jones

Company	Jordy Carter Furnishings	Office Outfitters and Planners	Pro Space Interiors	Source Office and Technology		
Addendum Acknowledged (1)	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes		
Signed Contractors Bid Form/Schedule	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes		
Tag Line Item C1 Unit Price	\$620.04	\$638.67	\$638.31	\$531.90		
Tag Line Item C1 Extended \$	\$620.04	\$638.67	\$638.31	\$531.90		
Tag Line Item C2 Unit Price	\$390.60	\$395.92	\$397.00	\$327.62		
Tag Line Item C2 Extended \$	\$2,734.21	\$2,771.44	\$2,779.00	\$2,293.34		
Tag Line Item C3 Unit Price	\$620.04	\$638.67	\$638.31	\$531.90		
Tag Line Item C3 Extended \$	\$7,440.51	\$7,664.04	\$7,659.72	\$6,382.80		
Tag Line Item D1 Unit Price	\$3,380.16	\$3,292.71	\$3,660.50	\$3,033.35		
Tag Line Item D1 Extended \$	\$3,380.16	\$3,292.71	\$3,660.50	\$3,033.35		
Tag Line Item L1 Unit Price	\$961.11	\$984.72	No Bid	\$861.11		
Tag Line Item L1 Extended \$	\$5,766.67	\$5,908.32	No Bid	\$5,166.66		
Tag Line Item T2 Unit Price	\$546.67	\$416.00	No Bid	\$219.35		
Tag Line Item T2 Extended \$	\$3,280.01	\$2,496.00	No Bid	\$1,316.10		
Total Price	\$23,221.60	\$22,771.18	\$14,737.53	\$18,724.15	\$0.00	\$0.00