|Grand Junction
(-(_‘___ COLORADO

MESA

COUNTY

BID RECAP

SOLICITATION TITLE:

Aggregate & Road Material 2016

SOLICITATION NUMBER:

IFB-4135-15-DH

OPENING DATE:

11/20/2015

OPENING TIME:

3:00pm

PROJECT MANAGER:

Dan Thorne/Heather Conger

BUYER NAME:

Duane Hoff Jr.

City of Grand Junction Pricing

Mesa County Pricing

Company

Acknowledged
Addenda 1 & 2

Contractor's
Bid Form

Revised -
Price Bid

Item 1 -
Streets
(3/8"
Chips)

Item 2 -
Streets
(3/4" Road
Base)

M. A. Concrete Construction, Inc.

No

No Yes

INo Bid

Moores Mining, LLC

No

Yes No

INo Bid

No Bid

Item A
(Class 5 -
Appleton)

INo Bid

Item B (Class
5-
Whitewater)

No Bid

Parkerson Construction

Yes

Yes

Yes

INo Bid

$10.90

$10.00

$6.75

Item C
(Class 5 -
Gateway)

Item D
(Class 6 -
Appleton)

Item E
(Class 6 -
Collbran/

Mesa)

Item E
(Class 5 -
Collbran/

Mesa)

Item F
(Class 6 -
DeBeque)

Item G (3/8"
Chips -
Mesa
County)

Item H
(Chat
Material -
Mesa
County)

Comments

$6.75

$8.00|No Bid [No Bid |No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Did not
acknowledge
Addendums 1
and 2. Did not
submit
Contractor's
Bid Form.

No Bid

No Bid |No Bid [No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Did not
acknowledge
addendums 1
and 2. Did notfl
utilize Revised
- Price Bid
Form.

$11.00 $11.00

United Companies

Yes

Yes No

$26.10

$15.60

Upland Companies

No

No Yes

Whitewater Building Materials

Yes

Yes

Yes

Elam Construction

Only #1

Yes No

INo Bid

$11.45

$13.25

$8.50

$7.80

$7.10

$8.50

$13.30

$12.80

$7.79

$7.79

$7.79

$8.03| $11.16| $10.88| $11.16

No Bid

No Bid

Did not utilize
Revised -
Price Bid
Form.

Did not
acknowledge
Addendums 1
and 2. Did not
submit
Contractor's
Bid Form.

$8.35

No Bid

Did not
acknowledge
Addendum 2.
Did not utilize
Revised -
Price Bid
Form.

Maxwell Products

No Bid

City Awards

Mesa County Awards







