
LIQUOR AND BEER MEETING 
LOCAL LICENSING AUTHORITY 

CITY OF GRAND JUNCTION, COLORADO 
MUNICIPAL HEARING ROOM, CITY HALL, 250 NORTH 5TH STREET 

 
M I N U T E S 

WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 7, 2018, 2:00 P.M.  

 
 

HEARING OFFICER SAM D. STARRITT 
   
I. CALL TO ORDER  
 

The meeting was called to order at 2:00 p.m.  Those present were Hearing Officer 
Sam Starritt, City Attorney John Shaver, and Deputy City Clerk Juanita Peterson. 

 
II. APPLICATIONS TO RENEW LIQUOR AND BEER LICENSES 
 

1. Orion Investments, LLC dba Charlie Dwellington’s, 103 N. 1st Street, Grand 
Junction, CO 81501, Tavern 

 
Lizann Sinclair, owner, was present.  The renewal application for Orion 
Investments, LLC dba Charlie Dwellington’s was found in order and approved. 
 

2. Texas Roadhouse Holdings, LLC dba Texas Roadhouse, 2870 North Avenue, 
Grand Junction, CO 81501-5011, Hotel and Restaurant 

 
No one was present to represent the applicant.  The renewal application for 
Texas Roadhouse Holdings, LLC dba Texas Roadhouse was found in order 
and approved. 
 

3. Grand Valley Public Radio Co., Inc. dba KAFM 88.1 Community Radio, 1310 
Ute Avenue, Grand Junction, CO 81501, Arts License 

 
No one was present to represent the applicant.  The renewal application for 
Grand Valley Public Radio Co., Inc. dba KAFM 88.1 Community Radio was 
found in order and approved. 
 

III. APPLICATIONS FOR SPECIAL EVENT PERMITS 
 
 1. Hilltop Health Services Corporation – “The Beacon & Hilltop Senior Life Options 

Valentine’s Dance – 2018” on February 10, 2018, from 7:30 p.m. to 10:30 p.m., 
Located at 625 27½ Road, Grand Junction, CO 81505, Malt, Vinous, and 
Spirituous 

 
  President:  J. Michael Stahl, 2599 Kayden Ct., Grand Junction, CO 81505 
  Event Manager:  Paige Cadman, 636 Cortney Way, Grand Junction, CO 81504 
 



Event Manager Paige Cadman was present and answered a series of questions 
regarding the event location, security, and how the event will be conducted 
lawfully. 
 
Hearing Officer Starritt asked if anyone present was in opposition of this Special 
Event Application being issued.  There was no one.  Hearing Officer Starritt 
entered Exhibits “A” and “B” (attached) into the record.   
 
Hearing Officer Starritt found that pursuant to Colorado State Statutes 12-48-
106, there are no grounds to deny the special event permit, it would not be 
injurious to the public welfare because of the nature of the special event, its 
location within the community, or the failure of the applicant in a past special 
event to conduct the event in compliance with applicable law.  The application 
for a Special Event Permit submitted by Hilltop Health Services Corporation – 
“The Beacon & Hilltop Senior Life Options Valentine’s Dance – 2018” was in 
order and approved. 
 

 2. Colorado Mesa University Foundation – “WCCC Culinary Program Valentine 
Dinner Fundraiser – 2018”, on February 14, 2018, from 5:30 p.m. to 9:00 p.m., 
Located at 2508 Blichmann Avenue, Grand Junction, CO 81505, Malt, Vinous, 
and Spirituous 

 
  President:  Liz Meyer, 710 Victor Drive, Grand Junction, CO 81506 
  Event Manager:  Wayne Smith, 2222 South Broadway, Grand Junction, CO 

81507 
 

Coordinator of Alumni and Campus Engagement Emma Leenerman was 
present to represent the applicant and answered a series of questions 
regarding the event location, security, and how it will be conducted lawfully. 
 
Hearing Officer Starritt asked if anyone present was in opposition of this Special 
Event Application being issued.  There was no one.  Hearing Officer Starritt 
entered Exhibits “A” and “B” (attached) into the record.   
 
Hearing Officer Starritt found that pursuant to Colorado State Statutes 12-48-
106, there are no grounds to deny the special event permit, it would not be 
injurious to the public welfare because of the nature of the special event, its 
location within the community, or the failure of the applicant in a past special 
event to conduct the event in compliance with applicable law.  The application 
for a Special Event Permit submitted by Colorado Mesa University Foundation 
dba “WCCC Culinary Program Valentine Dinner Fundraiser – 2018” was in 
order and approved. 

 
 
IV. APPLICATION FOR TRANSFER OF OWNERSHIP 
 

1. T.J.’s Billiards, LLC dba T.J.’s Billiards, 509 28 ½ Road, Grand Junction, 
Colorado 81501, Tavern formerly STIX Bar and Grill 
 
Owner:  Thelma J. Allen, 2765 Cheyenne Drive, Grand Junction, CO 81503 
 



Ms. Thelma Allen, owner, was present. 
 
Ms. Peterson reported that the paperwork was in order and all the reports are in 
compliance. 
 
Hearing Officer Starritt asked if there was anyone present against the issuance 
of this transfer.  He also recognized the applicant as being here before 
regarding the nonpayment of rent of the STIX Bar and Grill. 
 
There being no one, Hearing Officer Starritt approved the transfer of ownership 
of T.J.’s Billiards, LLC dba T.J.’s Billiards at 509 28 ½ Road, Grand Junction, 
Colorado. 
 

 
V. APPLICATIONS FOR NEW LICENSE – RESOLUTION, FINDINGS, AND DECISION 
 

1. FER Services, LLC, dba Garlic Knot, 637 24 ½ Road, Grand Junction, CO, 
81505, Hotel and Restaurant 

 
Member:  Masi Khaja, 2355 Yellow Cat Ct., Grand Junction, CO 81507 
Member:  Ryan Mizushima, 1007 Dougherty Ct., Grand Junction, CO 81505 
 
Present for the applicant was Ryan Mizushima, owner, and Lori Mizushima, 
marketing manager. 
 
Ms. Peterson reported the paperwork is in order and read the results of the 
survey (attached).   
 
There were several questions of the owner Mr. Mizushima regarding the 
application and diagram of the kitchen.  City Attorney Shaver asked questions 
regarding the survey of Ms. Lori Mizushima and how it was conducted.  City 
Attorney Shaver and Hearing Officer Starritt concurred that the information 
contained in the report from the City Clerk’s office indicates favoring issuance of 
this license based on the results of the survey.   
 
Hearing Officer Starritt asked if anyone would like to speak against the 
application.  There was no one.  He then said based on the information 
presented, there is no evidence that the application would not meet the needs 
and desires of the neighborhood and approved the application.  The City Clerk’s 
Office will prepare a resolution of findings for Hearing Officer Starritt’s signature. 
 

2. Martinez Family Corporation dba La Calle 5, 122 S. 5th Street, Grand Junction, CO 
81501, Tavern 

 
Owner:  Alfredo J. Martinez, 255 Lawrence Avenue, Grand Junction, CO 81501 

 
Present for the applicant was Cindy Enos-Martinez, sister-in-law and 
bookkeeper for the applicant along with Alfredo Martinez, Jr., son of the 
applicant and who conducted the needs and desires survey.   
 



Ms. Peterson reported the paperwork is in order and read the results of the 
survey (attached).   
 
There were several questions of Mr. Martinez regarding the needs and desires 
survey results and how it was conducted.  City Attorney Shaver and Hearing 
Officer Starritt concurred that the information contained in the report from the 
City Clerk’s Office indicates favoring issuance of this license based on the 
results of the survey.   
 
Hearing Officer Starritt asked if anyone would like to speak against the 
application.  There was no one.  He then said based on the information 
presented, there is no evidence that the application would not meet the needs 
and desires of the neighborhood and approved the application.  The City Clerk’s 
Office will prepare a resolution of findings for Hearing Officer Starritt’s signature. 

 
VI. OTHER BUSINESS  
 

1. Thai Chili, Inc. dba Thai Chili & Pho, 2536 Rimrock Drive, Suite 700, Grand 
Junction, CO 81505, Hotel and Restaurant – Review of insect issue 

 
Owner Onchi Ng and Emma McClelland, interpreter, were present.  Hearing 
Officer Starritt asked Mr. Ng if the issue with the insects has been taken care of.  
Mr. Ng stated yes. 

 
 Regina Clark with Mesa County Health Department was also present and 

confirmed they are satisfied with the results. 
 
 Hearing Officer Starritt found the renewal application in order for Thai Chili, Inc. 

dba Thai Chili & Pho approved it. 
 
VII. ADJOURNMENT 
   
 
NEXT REGULAR MEETING – February 21, 2018 











 
  











 


